Sarie AT

ORTITN TFL3IXTRTH

c‘.’)a’ew Ot B33
)
N — ¥ Boneetd, BFTT .40, @, H090( T, €, FTITE OFP.) S0.8.90
Part — IVA Bengaluru, FRIDAY, 31,JULY,2020( Shravana,9, ShakaVarsha 1942) No. 320

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION

NO. SAMVYASHAE 27 SHASANA 2020, BENGALURU, dated: 31.07.2020

The Industrial Disputes and certain other Laws (Karnataka Amendment)
Ordinance, 2020 0365%; meﬁé dong 3135c QT0ITOTD tmzsémejd miﬁ z:'i.@déci%, mmsé

SNJPIWN BT, 20208 FToFLT VRIS FOL: 15 Q0OTRN FTIFLT TOBITRY TFLRLIETOTD
STeOTTONT.
KARNATAKA ORDINANCE NO. 15 OF 2020

THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES AND CERTAIN OTHER LAWS (KARNATAKA
AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2020.

(Promulgated by the Governor of Karnataka in the Seventy-first year of the
Republic of India and first published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-Ordinary on
31st day of July, 2020)

An Ordinance further to amend the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the
Factories Act, 1948 and the Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition) Act, 1970
to provide measures to boost easy of doing business in the State of Karnataka.

Whereas it is expedient to provide measures to boost ease of doing business
in the State of Karnataka and for the matters connected therewith or incidental
thereto;

Whereas previous instructions of the President of India vide Order
No:14/07/2020-Judl..& PP, dated:11.07.2020 has been obtained in this regard
as required under the proviso to clause (1) of Article 213 of the Constitution.

Whereas the Karnataka State Legislative Assembly and the Karnataka
Legislative Council are not in session and the Governor of Karnataka is satisfied
that the circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate
action to promulgate the Ordinance for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

©



S

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article
213 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of Karnataka is pleased to
promulgate the following Ordinance, namely:-

1. Short title and commencement.-(1) This Ordinance may be called
the Industrial Disputes and Certain other laws (Karnataka Amendment)
Ordinance, 2020.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947.- In the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Central Act No.14 of 1947), in section 25K,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "one hundred", the words "three
hundred", shall be substituted; and
(ii) in sub-section (1A), for the words "one hundred", the words "three
hundred", shall be substituted.
3. Amendment of the Factories Act, 1948.- In the Factories Act, 1948
(Central Act No.63 of 1948),-
(1)  in section 2, in clause (m),-
(i) in item (i) for the words "ten or more", the words "twenty or more",
shall be substituted; and
(ii) in item (ii), for the words "twenty or more", the words "forty or more",
shall be substituted.
(2) in section 65, in sub section (3) in clause (iv) for the words
“seventy five” the words “one hundred and twenty five” shall be substituted.
4. Amendment of the Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition)
Act, 1970.- In the Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition) Act, 1970 (Central
Act No0.47 of 1970), in section 1, in sub-section (4) in item (a) for the words
"twenty or more", the words "fifty or more", shall be substituted.

VAJUBHAI VALA
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA

By Order and in the name of the

Governor of Karnataka,

(K.DWARAKANATH BABU)

Secretary to Government

Department of Parliamentary Affairs and
Legislation



a

TBodDead SBHONW DR ToIS TR Jedwovod
TRUI

30335: sos‘gmg 27 393 2020, Loriied), DT903: 31.07.2020

Ordered that the translation of the Industrial Disputes and certain other
Laws (Karnataka Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (Karnataka Ordinance 15 of
2020) in Kannada language, be published as authorized by the Governor of
Karnataka under section SA of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 in the
Karnataka Gazette for general information.

The following translation of the Industrial Disputes and certain other
Laws (Karnataka Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (Karnataka Ordinance 15 of
2020) in Kannada language is published in the Official Gazette under the
authority of the Governor of Karnataka under section SA of the Karnataka Official
Language Act, 1963.

20200 8ofe3d @mzsa’ezs ﬁoaﬁzs :15
éémaaa ATBRR DB) By VBT FoZPDNY (STere3d SWIBB) @médezs, 2020

(20903 M0 T OB IR0V IREBY BIFLT To@Ho00T ByWdTNG DA

20200 Sy 315¢ DT0BBOW BRFEIT TR DRSO SBpTeN @53TING).

BeEE38 DBV @3B0 IBDITY, DNRRR [ uBedDITB, BT,
VBRI TZN 3;1M0T0 IBNY WRIADD, 1947, SoEINY LD, 1948
DR M3 FDEST (oo D) SQaIed) B, 1970, DI, BB
T 00T @médezs.

Bofe3d 0o BO FBHT IBDIBR, DRIV  VBeBDIYT, D)
038, JoworRey, Horte BIHRONSDT  IRVDREMN  FTNTFY  LVBVODDITD
BN DHYBO0T;

903 FoJHeIT 2133 DIERT (1)Fe 20BB SCoDBT RO NSBBIBOI B

DOD P0BT T, BBO IPpAE KRWISNYRY 8ded Ko: 14/07/2020-B0dnBoe’.& D,

DNI03: 11.07.20200 W3 DBADYTO0T;



®

BRFEIB PRI D) Berdd PN BORID) wRTeBITTY RWODLITO0T D) VD
@R, B0 SoWDET GVTILBNVMN VTYTETB, @)WYAITLY, e FIBIY, SDBERWID
OBZREVRDBOE  ABBR[MW  svoLRNSabord  BeFLEE &R, e @eedrt
DHITeI NDIHTO0T;

S5, 903 JBodPeIT 2133 RIBT (1)Se WOBT VT FVITT WHTITBY
WD BRI EIBH DR @oD 8 BVODT VPYTEBTRY, B)WYAIWT, DOTT:-

1. B0 BID DA &,T0Y.- (1) B8 VPYWEBBIY, B30T TR D) BY)
VBT FodDNY (Boeresd SWBB) wreted, 2020 Dotd STASZW).

(2) ad B BPEJe 301t T3

2. 3,030 JTTNY HIADD, 19470 SWBB.- 3;M0T0 JD0BNEY LD,
19470 (19470 3e0T) QDD To. 14) 258 ZBTTO, -

(i) (Ne VBZBTTY “20otD IPT” D02 STAVT ‘Bt e oo BBRYY
3303,0edTBB,T; DI

(i) (1) LVDBBBTETO 20T I’ Do TV ‘WD IPW” D0V BTV
B)305,0eBT3BR).

3. BoFINY WHIALTD), 19488 SWBB.- FoerINY R, 1948380 (19483
3e0d; ¥R Bo. 63),-

(1) 23e ZBTEIT (20) 2OTTD, -

(i) ()Se WY “‘BR) VP BT A0V DWNET ‘WD) WTTo TR DO

BBNYRY, &33BT, TY; D)



R.N.I. No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297

3

(i) (i)e TRVITY QB D) TP BLIT” D0 BTNV TVOTR) P BT DO
BBRYRY, T 30deedT3B,3.

(2) 653 BBV (3)Fe  PLVBBBTLRTOR (iv)Fe WoBRY ‘BB, Do BBREN
2,00 Jp0e VBB, D0 BBNYRY, &30)eedT33,3).

4. HER oSV (AohoBe DR BRabed) wPJabD, 19708 SRIB.- LA
BocDEST (AoboZ)e DIB) BQIeE) RID, 197088 (19708 Beod) IPILTD To. 47)
13¢ BBTET (4)Je YVDZBTLRTOR (D) WRVATY “VT D) WPDo TLYT" D0 DWNET
‘VOTR) WFDe BeI'D0w BTNV, =308eedT3B,3.

The above translation of the Industrial Disputes and Certain other laws

(Karnataka Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (Karnataka Ordinance 15 of 2020) shall be

authoritative text in the Kannada language under section 5-A of the Karnataka Official

Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963).

TRV DI

BOIFLIBT oaasémod)

BB cmséme)d [SinltorWaple]
D) TT aa’rd@de)m

(3. ©9,0305F wor)
RBFTT To0EBDE
BoTDeod SSBHTR D)
TN O3S @0l

BBBD Terie BFeBBA:- FoBVTRZONW, BB ToRBS, 50 ZeoT) BwBEowad, Wornwed

SUNIL GARDE




		2020-07-31T16:05:33+0530
	SUNIL GARDE




