(Authoritative English text of this Department Notification No. Shram (A)3-4/2022 dated 15-
02, 2024 as required under clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India).

Government of Himachal Pradesh
Department of Labour & Employment

Khkk

Shram (A)3-4/2022  Dated: Shimla-171002, the 15" February, 2024

NOTIFICATION

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 112 of Factories Act,
1948 (Act No. 63 of 1948), the Governor, Himachal Pradesh proposes to make the following
rules further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Factories Rules, 1950 notified vide Industries
Department notification number D-80-12/48-11I, dated 06.05.1952 and the same are hereby
published in the Rajpatra (e-Gazette), Himachal Pradesh, for the information of general public,
as required under section 115 of the said Act.

If any person likely to be affected by these draft rules has any
objection(s) or suggestion(s) in respect of these rules, he may send the same to the Labour
Commissioner-cum-Chief Inspector of Factories, First Floor, New Himrus Building, Shimla-1,
within 45 days from the date of its publication in Rajpatra(e-Gazette), Himachal Pradesh;

The objection(s) or suggestion(s), if any, received within the

above stipulated period shall be taken into consideration before finalizing the said rules, namely:-

Short title and 1. (1) These rules may be called the Himachal

commencement Pradesh Factories (Amendment) Rules, 2024.
(2) These rules shall come into force from the
date of publication in the Rajpatra (e-Gazette),
Himachal Pradesh.

Amendment of rule 5 2. In the Himachal Pradesh Factories Rules, 1950
(hereinafter referred to as the ‘said rules’), for the
Schedule prescribed in sub-rule (2) of rule 5, the
following shall be substituted, namely:-



SCHEDULE

Fee for grant of licence for a factory for one year

Number of persons to be employed on any day during the year

Quantity

of Horse Power
installed
(Maximum
Horse Power)

to 09

From 10
to 20

From
21 to
50

From
51 to
100

From 101
to 250

From
251 to
500

From
501 to
1000

From
1001 to
1500

From
1501 to
2000

Above
2000

Nil

730

1460

2190

2920

5840

8760

13140

17520

26280

35040

Upto 20

1460

2190

2920

5840

8760

13140

17520

26280

35040

46720

Exceeding 20
but not
exceeding 50

2190

2920

5840

8760

13140

17520

26280

35040

46720

58400

Exceeding 50
but not
exceeding 100

2920

5840

8760

13140

17520

26280

35040

46720

58400

73000

Exceeding 100
but not
exceeding 250

8760

13140

17520

26280

35040

46720

58400

73000

81760

Exceeding 250
but not
exceeding 500

13140

17520

26280

35040

46720

58400

73000

81760

93440

Exceeding 500
but not
exceeding 1000

17520

26280

35040

46720

58400

73000

81760

93440

105120

Exceeding 1000
but not
exceeding 1500

26280

35040

46720

58400

73000

81760

93440

105120

116800

Exceeding 1500
but not
exceeding 2000

35040

46720

58400

73000

81760

93440

105120

116800

131400

Exceeding 2000
but not
exceeding 3000

46720

58400

73000

81760

93440

105120

116800

131400

146000

Exceeding 3000
but not
exceeding 5000

58400

73000

81760

93440

105120

116800

131400

146000

160600

Exceeding 5000
but not
exceeding 7000

73000

81760

93440

105120

116800

131400

146000

160600

175200

Exceeding 7000
but not
exceeding 10000

81760

93440

105120

116800

131400

146000

160600

175200

189800

Exceeding 10000
but not
exceeding 15000

93440

105120

116800

131400

146000

160600

175200

189800

204400

Above 15000

105120

116800

131400

146000

160600

175200

189800

204400

219000




Amendment of rule 6

Amendment of rule 8

Amendment of rule 10

Insertion of rule 12-A

In sub-rule (4) of rule 6 of the said rules, for the words
“Rupees One hundred” the words “Rupees Five Hundred”
shall be substituted.

In rule 8 of said rules, in sub-rule (3), for the words “one

hundred” the words “five hundred” shall be substituted.

In rule 10 of said rules, for the words “one hundred” the

words “five hundred” shall be substituted.

After rule 12 of the said rules, the following rule shall

be inserted, namely:-

“12-A (1) The Chief Inspector may recognize any person
as a ‘competent person’ within such area and for such
period as may be specified for the purposes of
carrying out tests, examinations, inspections and
certification for such buildings, dangerous machinery,
hoists and lifts, lifting machines and lifting tackles,
pressure plant, confined space, ventilation system and
such other process or plant and equipment as
stipulated in the Act and the rules made thereunder,
located in a factory, if such a person possesses the
qualifications, experience and other requirements as
set out in the SCHEDULE annexed to this rule:

Provided that the Chief Inspector may relax
the requirements of qualifications in respect of a
competent person but concurrence of the State
Government shall be taken and such a person after
being so recognized, shall not have powers of an
‘Inspector:

Provided further that the competent person
recognized under this provision shall not be above
the age of 62 years and shall be physically fit for the
purpose of carrying out the tests, examination and
inspection.

(1) The Chief Inspector may recognize an institution of

repute, having persons possessing qualifications and

experience as set out in the SCHEDULE annexed to



this rule for the purpose of carrying out tests,
examinations, inspections and certification for
buildings, dangerous machinery, hoists and lifts,
lifting machines and lifting tackles, pressure plant,
confined space, ventilation system and such other
process or plant and equipment as stipulated in the
Act and the rules made thereunder as a competent
person within such area and for such period as may
be specified.

(3) The Chief Inspector on receipt of an application in the
Form prescribed under the rule from a person or an
institution intending to be recognized as a competent
person for the purposes of this Act and the rules
made thereunder, shall register such application and
within a period of sixty days of the date of receipt of
application, either after having satisfied himself as
regards competence and facilities available at the
disposal of the applicant recognize the applicant as a
competent person and issue a certificate of
competency in the Form prescribed under this rule or
reject the application specifying the reasons thereof.

(4) The Chief Inspector may, after giving an opportunity
to the competent person of being heard, revoke the
certificate of competency,-

(i) If he has reason to believe that a competent
person,-
(a) has violated any condition stipulated in the
certificate of competency; or
(b) has carried out a test, examination and
inspection or has acted in a manner inconsistent
with the intent or the purpose of this Act or the
rules made thereunder; or has omitted to act as
required under the Act and the rules made
thereunder; or

(i1) for any other reason to be recorded in writing.



Explanation: For the purpose of this rule, an
institution includes an organization.

(5) The Chief Inspector may, for reasons to be recorded
in writing, require re-certification of lifting
machines, lifting tackles, pressure plant or
ventilation system, as the case may be, which has
been certified by a competent person outside the
State.

(6) Application for grant of certificate of competency
shall be accompanied by a non-refundable fee of X
25,000 (Rupees Twenty Five Thousand) and a
security amount (without interest) of ¥ 1,00,000/-
(Rupees One Lakh) which shall be deposited in
Major Head 0230-00-104-01 through HIMKOSH.

(7) Application for renewal of Certificate of Competency
shall be accompanied by a non-refundable fee of ¥
25,000/~ (Rupees Twenty Five Thousand) which
shall be deposited in the Major Head 0230-00-104-
01 through HIMKOSH



Form of application for grant of Certificate of
Competency to a person under sub-rule (I) of rule
12A.

1. Name

2. Date of Birth

3. Name of the Organisation (if not self-employed)

4. Designation

5. Educational qualification (copies of testimonials to

be attached)
6. Details of professional experience (in chronological

order)

Name of the Organization  Period of Service Designation Area of Responsibility

7. Membership, if any, of professional bodies
8. (i) Details of facilities (examination, testing,
etc.) at his disposal.
(i) Arrangements for calibrating and
maintaining the accuracy of these facilities.

9. Purpose for which Competency Certificate is
sought (section or sections of the Act should be
stated).

10. Whether the applicant has been declared as a
competent person under any statute (if so, the
details)

11. Any other relevant information.

12. Declaration by the applicant.

Lo , hereby declare that the information

furnished above is true. I undertake:-

(a) to maintain the facilities in good working order,
calibrated periodically as per manufacturers
instructions or as per National Standards; and

(b) to fulfill and abide by all the conditions stipulated in
the certificate of competency and instructions issued
by the Chief Inspector from time to time.

Place &

Date Signature of the applicant :



Declaration by the Institution (if employed)

I, v, certify that Shri ..o, whose

details are furnished above, is in our employment and

nominate him on behalf of the organisation for the
purposes of being declared as a competent person under
the Act. I also undertake that I will,-

(a) notify the Chief Inspector in case the competent
person leaves our employment;

(b) provide and maintain in good order all facilities at his
disposal as mentioned above;

(c) notify the Chief Inspector any change in the facilities
(either addition or deletion)

Signature

Designation

Telephone No.

Official Seal

Date:

Form of Application for grant of Certificate of

Competency to an Institution under sub-rule (2) of

Rule 12A.

1. Name and full address of the Organisation

2. Organisation’s status (specify whether Government,
Autonomous, Co-operative, Corporate or Private)

3. Purpose for which Competency Certificate is sought

(specify section(s) of the Act)

4. Whether the Organisation has been declared as a
competent person under this or any other statute. If so,
give details.

5. Particulars of persons employed and possessing
qualification and experience as set out in Schedule
annexed to rule 12A.

6. Details of facilities and arrangements made for their

maintenance and arrangements made for their
maintenance and periodic calibration.

7. Any other relevant information.



8. Declaration:

OO hereby, on behalf of ...............
Certify that the details furnished above are correct to the
best of my knowledge. I undertake to-

(i) maintain the facilities in good working order,
calibrated periodically as per manufacturers instructions
or as per National Standards; and

(i) to fulfill and abide by all the conditions stipulated in
the certificate of competency and instructions issued by

the Chief Inspector from time to time.

Signature of Head of the
Institution or of the person

authorised to sign on his behalf.

Designation

Place & Date

Form of Certificate of Competency issued to a
person or an institution in pursuance of rule
12(A).



| I , Chief Inspector of Factories, Himachal
Pradesh, Shimla, in exercise of the powers conferred on
me under section 2(ca) of the Factories Act, 1948 and
rules made thereunder hereby recognize
....................................... to be competent person
for the purpose of carrying out tests, examinations,
inspections and certifications of equipments under
................ which are used in a factory located in
Himachal Pradesh under sections and rules mentioned

below against competent person:-

Name & Address of Section/rules
competent person/
institution
This certificate is valid upto .............. or the date, the

Occupational Safety, Health and Working Conditions

Code, 2020 and rules made thereunder, shall come into

force, whichever is earlier.

This certificate is issued subject to the conditions
stipulated hereunder.

1. Tests, examinations and inspections shall be carried
out in accordance with the provisions of the Act and
the rules made thereunder, and record of tests shall
be maintained in a register

2. Tests, examination and inspection shall be carried
out under direct supervision of the competent person
and the date of test examination be informed to the
Inspector i.e. Deputy Director Factories/ Assistant
Director Factories under whose jurisdiction factory
is located well in advance. Any testing without prior
intimation as stated above shall not be accepted.

3. The competent person shall procure all necessary
equipments/facilities and maintain the same in good
working order and inform to the Inspector i.e.

Deputy Director Factories/ Assistant Director



Factories under whose jurisdiction factory is located
about the equipment used in testing work.

4. Where maximum permissible working pressure is
reduced or the examination shows that the pressure
vessels or plant or any part thereof, cannot continue
to be used safely unless certain repairs are carried
out or unless any other safety measures are required
to be taken the report shall be sent to concerned
Inspector i.e. Deputy Director Factories/ Assistant
Director Factories and copy of the same shall also
be sent to the undersigned within 7 days of
completion of the examination.

5. The Institution recognized as competent person shall
keep the undersigned informed about the name of the
competent person who leave the organization. The
certificate of competency issued shall stand
cancelled if all of above named person(s) leave the
organization.

6. Monthly return shall be submitted covering names of
Factories, list of equipments/vessels tested, date of
test, number and date of certificate issued, working
pressure or safe load allowed and special remarks if
any by the 10" of every month.

7. The Chief Inspector of Factories reserves the rights
to revoke or amend this ovder at any time during its
validity.

8. The competent person shall take photographs and
make recordings during the course of Tests,
examinations and inspections and make it readily
available as and when demanded by Chief Inspector
of Factories.

Application for renewal of competency certificate

may be made at least one month before the expiry of

this certificate

Chief Inspector of Factories
Shimla-1, Himachal Pradesh



SCHEDULE

Sr.
No.

Section or
Rules under
which
competency is
recognized

Qualification
required

Experience for
the purpose

Facilities at
his
command

2.

4.

Rules made
under Section
6 and Section
112 -
Certificate of
stability  for
buildings

Degree in Civil
or  Structural
Engineering; or
equivalent

i) A minimum of
10 years
experience in
the design of
construction
or testing or
repairs of
structures;

ii) Knowledge
of non-
destructive
testing,
various codes
of  practices
that are
current  and
the effect of
the wvibrations
and natural
forces on the
stability of the
building; and

iii) Ability to
arrive  at a
reliable
conclusion
with regard to
the safety of
the structure
or the
building.

Rules made
under Section
21(2) -
“Dangerous
Machines”

Degree in
Electrical or
Mechanical or
Textile
Engineering or
equivalent.

(1) a minimum of
7 years
experience in-
a) design or
operation or
maintenance; or
b) testing,

examination
and inspection
of  relevant
machinery,
their  guards,
safety devices

Guages  for
measurement
;  instruments
for
measurement
of speed and
any other
equipment or
device to
determine the
safety in the
use of the
dangerous




and machines.
appliances.

(ii) he shall —

a) be conversant
with  safety
devices and
their  proper
functioning ;

b) be able to
identify
defects  and
any other
cause loading
to failure;
and) have
ability to
arrive at a
reliable
conclusion
with regard to
the proper
functioning of
safety device
and appliance
and machine
guard.

(1) A minimum
experience of 7
years in-

(a) design or
erection or
maintenance; | Facilities for
or load testing,

(b)  inspection | tensile
and test | testing,
procedures of | guages
lifts and | equipment/

A degree in hoists; gadgets  for

Section 28 — | Electrical and |(ii) He shall be — | measurement

Hoists and | /or Mechanical |(a) Conversant | and any other

Lifts Engineering or | with  relevant | equipment

the equivalent codes of | required for
practices  and | determining
test procedures | the safe
that are current; | working

(b) Conversant | conditions of

with other | Hoists  and
statutory Lifts.
requirements

conversing the
safety of the
Hoists and
Lifts;




(©) able  to
identify defects
and arrive at a
reliable
conclusion with
regard to the
safety of Hoists
and Lifts.

Section 29 —
Lifting

Machinery and
Lifting Tackles

Degree in
Mechanical or
Electrical or
Metallurgical

Engineering or
its equivalent

(i) A minimum
experience of 7
years in-

(a) design or
erection or
maintenance; or
(b) testing,
examination and
inspection,  of
lifting
machinery,
chains,
and
tackles.
(i1) He shall be —
(a) Conversant
with the
relevant codes
of practices and
test procedures
that are current;
(b) Conversant
with  fracture
mechanics and
metallurgy  of
the material of
construction;
(c) Conversant
with heat
treatment/
stress relieving
techniques  as
applicable  to

ropes
lifting

stress  bearing
components
and parts of
lifting
machinery and
lifting tackles;
(d) capable of
identifying
defects and

arriving at a
reliable
conclusion with

Facilities for
load testing,
tensile
testing, heat
treatment,
equipment/
gadget  for
measurement,
gauges and
such  other
equipment to
determine the
safe working
conditions of
the lifting
machinery
tackle.




regard to the
safety of lifting
machinery,
chains, ropes,
and lifting
tackles.

Section 31 -
‘Pressure Plant

Degree in
Chemical or
Electrical or
Metallurgical or
Mechanical

Engineering or
its equivalent.

(i) A minimum
experience  of
10 years in-

(a) design or
erection or
maintenance, or

(b) testing,
examination
and inspection
of pressure
plants.

(ii) He shall be—

(a) Conversant
with the
relevant codes
of practices and
test procedures

relating to
pressure
vessels;

(b)  Conversant
with  statutory
requirements
concerning the
safety of

unfired pressure
vessels and
equipment
operating under
pressure;

(c) Conversant
with non-
destructive
testing
techniques  as
are applicable
to pressure
vessels;

(d able to
identify defects
and arrive at a

reliable

conclusion with
regard to the
safety of

pressure plants.

Facilities for
carrying out
hydraulic
test, non-
destructive
test, gauges
equipment/
gadgets  for
measurement
and any other
equipment or
gauges to
determine the
safety in use
of  pressure
vessels.




(1) a minimum of
7 years in

collection and
analysis of
environmental
samples and
calibration  of
monitoring
(1) Section 36 equipment;(ii)
—Precautions He shall —
against (a) be conversant
q :
angerous with the Meters,
fumes(ii) hazardous .
. Instruments
Rules  made properties  of .
: . and devices
under sections chemicals and dul
41 and 112 their S
: o calibrated
concerning Masters degree | permissible .
. o . . . and certified
ship-building |in  Chemistry, | limit values; .
. , for carrying
and ship | or a degree in| (b) be
. . . out the tests
repairs, Chemical conversant with
. : . and
Handling and | Engineering. the current . .
. . certification
processing  of techniques  of .
. of safety in
asbestos, sampling  and . :
: working  in
Manufacture analysis of the
. confined
of Rayon by environmental
. . spaces.
VISCOSE contaminants;
process, and
Foundry (c) be able to
operations. arrive  at  a
reliable
conclusion  as
regards the
safety in
respect of
entering  and
carrying out hot
work.
Ventilation (1) A minimum of | Facilities for
systems as 7 years in the | testing  the
required under design, ventilation
various fabrication, system,
Schedules installation, instruments
framed under .| testing of | and  gauges
. Degree n o :
section 87, . ventilation for testing the
Mechanical or :
such as . system and | effectiveness
Electrical
Schedules on : . systems  used | of the
o Engineering or . .
Grinding or . for  extraction | extraction
. equivalent. .
glazing or and collection | systems  for
metals and of dusts, fumes | dusts,
processes and and vapours and | vapours and
incidental other ancillary | fumes, and
thereto, equipment. any other
Cleaning  or (i1)) He shall be | equipment




smoothing,
roughening,
etc. of articles,
by a jet sand,
metal shot, or
grit, or other
abrasive
propelled by a
blast of
compressed air
of steam.

conversant with
relevant codes
of practice and
tests procedures
that are current
in respect of
ventilation and
a traction
system for
fumes, and
shall be able to
arrive  at  a
reliable
conclusion with
regard to
effectiveness of
the system.

needed  for
determining
the efficiency
and adequacy
of these
systems. He
shall have the
assistance of
a suitable
qualified
technical
person  who
can come to a
reasonable
conclusion as
to the
adequacy of
the system.

skokksk

By order,

Secretary (Lab. & Emp.) to the
Government of Himachal Pradesh.




fRarae IeY WReR
9 Ud AoNTR fIamT

%k %k k%

[T 5 () 3—4 /2022 ARG RMe—171002, 15 BNl 2024

oY SAfEREET
fRrad US9 & IroUUTd, BREMT SIfSfraH, 1948 (1948 T ffSfeaH
A& 63) P URT 112 §RT U< WKAT BT YANT PR gY, AN 90T & SAfSgan
T $1-80—12 /48—11I, AR 06—05—1952 I IMEFRT 3R YR fZAR—E o™
HREFT 78, 1950 &1 3R e o) @ forv f=faled w99 &1 uamg axd &

IR IT I AWIH B gRT 115 & S JAT AU S AR Bl AT B oIy
o193 (§—7To1e), fRTae UeeT # TdggRT UHIRa fdhar Srar &;

3 ey Rl gRT dwrer ywifad B arel feely afad & afe s+
sl @ g PIs omE" AT Ped § /T, Al 98/ d S= Sad Uy FEHl & Ieum
E—Tore), R uew # uerM @ R 9 Uarfera fam @ safr & iR M
AYFT—TI— HRYMT [*RIeTh, GO e, g 2R 9o, Riei—1 DI 4 FdM/ Feobdl |

SR fraa @ & fior U sme a1 gera, If IS B/ 8 W I e B
3ifom 3U o1 9§ qd faar | fHar sme, ereria—

1. A 9™ R URM— (1) 39 Al &1 Sfera am fREree T eREEr (Fee)
2024 ¥ |
(2) I oM STUA (3—Tole), f2merdt Iaer § U &l R 9§ Ug< 81 |
2. W 5 @7 HuRE- e URw sRET H, 1950 (R g9H 9@ UvEn Sdd
a9 @er T B) & w5 & Iu fm (2) 9 faftd STEd @ v R fefaRad v
ST, 3ferf—




SRl

IREM & {7 1@ 98 & oy rgsifta UsH &< 3 Yoo

99 & IRM fHA @Y fa7 Fafora fg ST arel aafeaa @ sifdreas e

09
ddh

10 9
20 TP

21 9
50 TP

59 W
100
REQ

101 9
250 dd

251 9
500 dd

501 ¥
1000
NEQ

1001 9
1500
g

1501 9
2000
g

2000 9

730

1460

2190

2920

5840

8760

13140

17520

26280

35040

1460

2190

2920

5840

8760

13140

17520

26280

35040

46720

2190

2920

5840

8760

13140

17520

26280

35040

46720

58400

2920

5840

8760

13140

17520

26280

35040

46720

58400

73000

8760

13140

17520

26280

35040

46720

58400

73000

81760

13140

17520

26280

35040

46720

58400

73000

81760

93440

17520

26280

35040

46720

58400

73000

81760

93440

105120

26280

35040

46720

58400

73000

81760

93440

105120

116800

35040

46720

58400

73000

81760

93440

105120

116800

131400

46720

58400

73000

81760

93440

105120

116800

131400

146000

58400

73000

81760

93440

105120

116800

131400

146000

160600

73000

81760

93440

105120

116800

131400

146000

160600

175200

7000 ¥ 3H
R 10,000 A
SIEEIRE

81760

93440

105120

116800

131400

146000

160600

175200

189800

10,000 Kl
Affs  W_g
15,000 Kl
Aferp 8

93440

105120

116800

131400

146000

160600

175200

189800

204400

15,000 3
CIBEY

105120

116800

131400

146000

160600

175200

189800

204400

219000




w6 &1 FuneH

w8 &1 genuH

9 10 &1 AeEE

9 12 & BT AT~

Sad faH @ 9| 6 @ Su | (@) | ue |
Y& & IE W U | e W ST |

Sad el & w8 & Su 9w (3) H, e |l
Y&l & IE WU |l e W S |

I Ml @ PR 10 W, 'Te 917 WeRl @ I W)
"giE Al e W S |

Sad Al & e 12 & gvanq fefaRea e
AT Tohar QT 3ferid.—

"2 - (1) @ FNas &N e o @ e 4o
IR U oy, SRt VW Wadl, WaRAd "R,
Sdlerd @R forde, fafdeT weim ok fafieT Sod,
R wie, fiffd WM, adg@ed yomell 3R
SREET H @Red VAT /g uftedr I wId @R
SRR (SUPRVT) SIS iR dgdi= a=1g 7Y
Al # fafzd 2 2q wRieror, wder (SE), o &k
YA BRI R d T =g faffdse @1 S,
e Ifdd & U H ARGl © 9o, I Ul BIS
afed g a9 9 e syl # g fiRa
BT, AT AR =T IFUETTY el &,

R 9 FRIeTs | Afdd & Jag |
rEarsll o1 3resi H BT« W, fdhg 9T WER
DI FEA ol ST 3R U Afdd & U 39 UBR
BT,

WRg Y8 IR b 39 Sudy & el
AT U e Afdd’ &I MY 62 a9 W 3fAd el
Bl 3R a8 weror, wher iR FReror wrffaa e
@ YISO ¥g TRING ¥ & ¥4 8T |
(2) T= R fHdl ufiftsd e &1 39 o 9
AT SFIRgAl § ger feiRa srEdmell &R argwd
Sdlad iR forme, fafteT #efm &R fafdeT Sovd,
JeR e, fufd e, ardrgger  Yomell el




R QiR dgel @rg v Al | genfaiRa
fafed &N o= ufthar a1 FUF @R SUGRUT (STR)
Tg WRIerr, W, FRieor 3R yHv Briffad dRe
% TAoH =g U &F H SR U eafd, ot fafza
DI Y, & oIy Aerq Afdd & U H AFRIAT UG B
HD |

(3) g=u ferd, s M SRk aqe| a9 Ty
Al & WA @ oy \ed afed’ & U H AR
Ut B & forg omerfyd el aafad ar fodt den
I 39 faw & orefig fafed uou & emded ura B
TR UH 3MAeT Bl ISR B 3R e YT
B @ AN W 96 3T @ @y & iR a1 ar
3fTIEd DI SHAT AR U GGAensil & ey H @I
BT T B & UTAN ATAGDH B T FeTH Aok’
% BY H AgAr oI IR 39 H @ e fafzd
USU H CWHAT THIOT UF SN BT AT BIRON Bl

fafffase #=d Y aMTded &I SRAIBR BT |

(4) ge=g e, Wem Afdd B GAdls & AT

UG axA P UTAN, AEHal Bl YHV-HA ufonied
PR FDI,—

() afs SHa fowa &1 98 &R © & e afad
3

(@) e yAmE # kg fe@ N wd @
Sootee fbar ) ar

(@) =9 A a1 age= §9e Y Al & yare
& fow oIg, weror, wenm iR Aeror prifead fvan
T O U QMM W I e AT W e far ®
JqaT 39 SIRAIFTH @R AgEE ¥\ g U Ml &
3 e smufdra fhvfy & &1 A fopar 2

(i) foRea # sfwfaRad ey o & &N s
BRI & forg |

WA 39 W & oM & fog, WRen &
T ST W § |




(5) g fiets, wRoT &1 foalaa # sfafaRad ova,
JiRera, fafter #efql, fafdeT Soha, JeR wiie A
qAHeT gomell & g gAfieR, o s &
qrex fpdfl e wfdd gRT yAIord fear T € @l
LT R HH T |

(6) WerTT UHIT UH USM BRI TG UG, B0
25000 /— (G B9IR TUY) &1 IMfacd HiE 3R
B0 100,000 /— (VH oG TU) &I ol Ifed gfed
gferqfa xed & A fhar oo, N ey @
AerH W Y= ¥ 0230—00—104—01 W ST fdr
ST |

(7) FTHAT UHIO-UH @ AJHIGRY & foIg JMMAe B0
25000 /— (7= BOIR BW) dI Wfacd ® &
A1y fpar srem, 59 iy & weam 9 g oY
0230—00—104—01 H ST fhar STQam |




R 12 @) @S- (1) @ orfie frll =afed & |erar JooT U5 UeH &’A & forg 3imaeH

IS &7 ToU

1 A

2 o faf

3 e &1 9W (3fe, =it 7 &)

4  UgAW

5 Sl arddr (T A Ui e @ W)

6 AGHIIS (IRIP) G & R (BTATIHHD HH H)
TS BT A AT o qafy IEH (@i &1 &r7)

7 ARG MR B e, afe dIg e

8 (i) & fueH # wgfderall (oier, uRleror onf) & faavoT |
(i) 37 ugfaerail @1 FEIBAT BT fLTRNET DR IR REV B Dbl FqeI HRAT |

9 yIH oI foy AeHar UHoE AR T B QRIETEE @ ORT a1 ORIRH $1 Seord fdhar
S |

10 7 MMIeH &l fHe aRFRM (Rege) & kA |ed afad & v # aifd far = & @fe
T & Al @) |

11 BIg 3 AT LI |

12 3Md&d §RT HIYoT |
L A TAGERT N0 &Rl & fF SR & 73 qa 9 8| # 999 <ar § —

(@)  fafemiar & el @ AR a1 IS ABl b AR TGS DI AL BTl |
(GeraRerd HRIATe) H JIRIE HRA1, Td HifcTeha: LR BRI, 3R

(@)  derwar wHoT gx H fAfed WA el T SIUTE Rl iR P fled gRT
HI—FHI R SR el @ gl &R |

L1 A JMITH B THIER
1S

SINEC]

T gRT ' (Ife fAafed / srikd 2))

L THTOTT BRAT B B B ISEEA

faarer R faar 11 7, 'R e # 2 iR 99 i & onfe ve wem @fdd aiftg
Py S & TG B ST @l 3R 9 39 Ug WR AMMHET el 2| H Ig W 9o adl
g fo-

@) Al | fdT gaRT oA B odl @ aF 99 FRied &1 g o,




Sqd AUeH W SR JAERTd FEE Ggfaund g PR AR GIdwl gHIY
NE-;

ygfaenstl # @Is uRad= (@ a1 ger faar S e ARiere o Jferd o= |
BXIER

qeTH

R AT

EIREAIRER I

RINECE

o\ 12—31 & S99 (2) & SriF fdll AR &1 el YHIU-UF UG &R & forg
e U |

1
2
3

FIST BT M AR YRT Uar

e @ eraa ((Rfde & o 71 e, W, agen, Afia ar fAoh ?)
TS foIa oy e UAToT—u= /i T ' @ISR @ aRd fAfdse @)

R TS BT 39 A7 foell o fafy & a9 | aafag o foar wrar 2 9y =,
ar faaor § |

R 12 &1 | Hor e gl # Ry U & SrgaR FEfTd ok sréar v arel aafdaa
o1 fafrfee |

IAD REAT & oIy B Mg FaRABI BT [daR0T 3R IAD STREVT 3R HfoTaher:
3R & Ty 1 75 aery |

DTS I FAEITT G|

HIY0T—

£ E TICGERT oo @ AR W YU dRar g (b
SWIFT &1 T8 SFGRI AR TR & JFAR Fel ¢ |
q-

(i) famr & e a1 IS "l & SR ugfauel B Wl gled W geaiierd
PHRIATAT ARIET B 3R BIfoThel: FTMHA B; AR

(ii) \ergan waror U W faffde @i w@l ok g FRigs gRT 99—99d W SR
Al B ot B MR AT HRT BT Fa= <l & |

I 3R AR oo A & U a1 39 A
ferepd fdd & IR |

a9 12 (31) & SR ¥ fHl) fd a1 T Bl SINT HerHadT YAT—UF P Urey



L A Y HREH [FRieTdh, Farae yaer, R sRaEm g+, 1048
B GRT 2 (T &) 3R ddI= g9 M 4 gRT g31 Uas Al b1 YA BRd 8 ...
............................ Pl AGERT oo, D IR UGN ST fRATAA TS H @R
PREM H YANT BT 7 8 § I o9, aew], FREor iR gHvH SRiad d-d &
TIoH @ foy e @fdd @ 9 & @9 qWis T8 ORI iR R & oA dHew
IR B B AIAT <l Gi—

et Afdd / R BT A SR T aRT / fom

TG TATIT UF s qh I I ARG TP QIS GRE, W@y AR
FHrdeemd AfRdr, 2020 3R TGN F9Q Y R ygw B8R, S off ydax &1 e 2
IE YEIH 9D g ad et & sreued Sy far w2

1. Sird, aRIEor 3R FReor 39 SIf=g¥ 3fR age= 991 ¢ FrEi & U« & R by
SIGI 3R URIEol 6T el ISR H FRIad fHar Sirg |

2. Sifd, GRIET0T IR FRleror Herd fdd & e qddetor & efF fovy S @ik flerss srerfq
U v FREMT/ FERId Fevie dRE, Na! feRar § sREmr aRed g, &l
Sifd/ IR0 B IR ARH w9 FlEd B S | [SuBd qd gaT & 95 o o
TRIEToT Wiiehd el fdhar ST |

3. W Al T oavdd ISR/ FAUR B [UE B AR THB HE BT H
(GeraRerd ®Ri @Tel) JgRfard & SR Rt 31 U esid dREMT/ Helkid
e SR, e JAfIRIRGT § SREMT AR 7, Bl Wl SR H ITINT fHy 7Y
IURRO B IR H GRIT BT |

4. T8I 3TPHaH AT BRIATE gd1d &ioT 81 A7 § AT Wiell § SR 8iar 8 & g9 = A
FIF T THBT DIS AN, Sd Tb BT ARG 61 DI il fqal Sq qh Plg 3= FReaTl
IUg A TE fHY O, 99 9% SAST SUANT R 9 SR T8 3@ Fad | S
Rue w=g Mlgs g SU Feerd aREMT/ 98d feed dREMT B ol S
3R g U Ui wierr gof 89 & w1d a7 & fiar sreigwanery @ off Wl SeE |




5. W& Afd & WY H AGAl UKl AT, W Bls dlel 9&H g &AM & aN H
R BT Gfad wll | afe YT FRa aafad Ted @ Bl <d & al okl faar
T WeTHAT JHTU—U3 g B3I FHel ST |

6. B HEIT @I 10 ARG Tb HREMI & A, GIE0T fhy MY IYSHRON /U=l H Gl wWieor
B ARG, SR fBY 7Y Ga70T 0 Pl G&AT AR ARG, BRI qarg I AT R AR
IR faeiy fewforn, afs ®Ig 281, &1 Al wd gY A1 faarofl Uwga @l Sl |

. P& SREMT RIS & U 9 QY Bl g9 ddl & SR (Al 9 q9Y gfadgd &
AT M B & BR Jrfrd B |

8. TRIeroll, UieTall SR RIS & R1F We™ Ffdd BICHT® ol 3R RPIST 0 iR g
HREMT FRIeTd gRT 519 AN Y a1 96T Agoidl H SUeTel HRaTgT |

~

HETAT JAIOT U & GBI @ Y AAeT $H9 YA U & SEHM W HH 9 HH Y A U4
foham QT |

&I SR [FRIeTd
feeeret gar Ree—1



gl

oRT a1 e e
fF  wermar @l
HIar €1 T8

e sredl

Ao & fog arga

UG]S SHd
=T % 21

gRT 6 AR IRT 112
P orf| §9g U
g — 9o+l gg
ReRdr w3

gofferafT e
51011 C B | B R e o)
TR |

() \eERl & e @
feomrss a1 weor AT
R § =Aa9 10 a9
PT 3FHA;

(i) IR—fAreTdmsr e,
ST yafad / faemme €
3R 99 DI ReRar )
PO AR UGS
ufdqal & waEa @
;3R

(iii) =T AT WA Pl
e b ey A
e ey w

UgaT DI T |

gRT 21(2) & 3Ef=

AU v g

9

)

gonfafar H
SUfS I SED
THPRET |

() (@) TSSmgT a1 HdTel
AT SRETT AT
(@) gETT T @
IYBIUN DT ONETT,
TRIeTor 3R fderor #
HH H B 7(A1d) a9
DT 3FJHI—
(i) 98—
(@) JRET [UBRN AR
SECIIEICOEEIUENIRT
A Y AT B
(@) FfeAt &1 ik AT
% A% B @& fodl
I HRU Dl UgA
P H | B SR
qfe gRelT,  gRel
SURRYT TAT SRR B
Ifad iU & Hay
H# v ey W
RECE B B RINC | |
Bl

gRT 28 — SAIAAD
3R forde

golfdeda AR/

() (@) feomga a1 famf

a7 Jebfhel

IT GRYTT; (37RETO0)

s Uefur, g
qdefor A9 & forw




IS AT FHEGET |

| 31erdr

TIAT TRIRTOT AT

(@) forgel ofk S<ireTd!
P R QIR uReqor
yfharell § &1 | oH
7 Y BT A

(i) () a8—

3R TRIeTor ufsharat, i
yaferd € 9 uRferd =
@) Saes iR foder
D JREAT A HIRd 3
Jurfs emuemell W
Wﬁ;

(M) FfeM d yged dRe
IR Iddd 3R forded
P JREAT  Hey H
fowgai =y w
uga H Ae |

SUBRY /I AR
SAlddd iR fordet
D[R BrigEn
B fRgiRd &
T oufara fosedt off
3 SUBUY TG

ugfaumg |

gRT 20 forfoesr
e s forfteT
Sh

i) (@) fesrsa ar oA
JT YERE(T (ITR&IT), T,
@) fafeT T
fafrer  Sdpa @
TR, weor 3R
fRletor 7 B | BH

(gFa|) 7 @i @
SNGEN
(ii) 78~
(®)gETd FIER  |fgamil
3R weror ufshamatl, <
vaferd € | 3raeTd 8T
(@) af~=Aor @ ARl &
GFeR i@ &R o1g
fasm= & e &
(M S YeY /S99
foefeE arer gedl 8l
foafreT 7oy & ==t
ik fafdedT Cwa
qe-al | gRfad 2e;
3R
@) fafewr 7,
fafeT Swpa o grenm

A9, TN ® foU
dle  Te, aAa
, T
SR/ e &
forw ok fafde
N Shd B
e sRIRf
B fRgiRd &
g W I
SYTRRI P
o] |




3 < ¥ ged @

ugd™ R AR
fdegaw sy 2w
Uga H |HT BT |

ORI 31— <419
qIH
(R wie)

AR a7
Solfdgdal a1 o1g
ERIBGESINET)
Jerar  Hdfdba
ol H
IS1e 11 | -R:
AHDE |

(i) (@) sfrwey (Eome)
ar fEer a1 SR
¥ H9 9 B9 10 99
DT 3TIHT AT~

(@) <9 |IE @
o, W 3R
FoReqoT |

(ii) a5~

(@) <@ 9H W gaEId
e dfgarll iR
wWieer  ufeansil W
ey gRferd =,

(@) 3rfieme IfFa <ard
uEl R gaa H
gRarferd  SUBRON DI
JReAT ¥ HefSd Jenfrs
ettt & uRfad &
(M) &M@ uEl R OAR]

B9 el IR-fAATrerdRY

R dah-ral F aRkfad

B,

(&) Ffesl @1 ygaA HRA

3R Tarad FIAT DI GReT

3 ey H fIwgwH™

=Py R Uga H eEw

e BT |

BISgileld  RIET,
R
T AT =G I,
SURRUT/ FH IR
CEICAR: | B
IWRT H gReT
faiRa &= 7g
EZERC ISR I

gRT 36— WA
gu o AT

(i) o1 41 3R 112
CS G IE BRI
T iR T
Pl HRHA, TRTH
2 15 B 14

UhHOT, IBESARS
UfhaT gRT YA BT
APror s

HTe T |

e fage #
fomg Surfer
G SOl ARAT
H 3uTfer |

(i) waferer AT & HUB
3R fagelyor 3R argsrao
@A) SuERe B
JPMHA H HH F HH 7 9
BT 3T |

(1) a8—

(@) AIE D FARATD
T R TS gAY
A gt | uRfaa
Bl

@) T B A
GERICIEC N G|
QIIEReT  Hg¥dI ¥

NAT e 7 Brd
PR W OGRET Db
TRTEToT

g7 Bl
R I=F B fafdraa
areTifeha 3R
gAIfoTa e S|




aRferd 81 3R
(1) SS9 BRI B IRA 3R
e & Hag H o OgRel
EANCIECIRCEE RN I o

W UgaT # e 8|

ORI 87 @ oMM | Jorted () aageFEReRm) | go, aw 3R gy
T T ffe | sofaged yorel ok gonferail @ | ®g fYepyOr womedt
aﬂ[%l—?ﬁ @ 3rfie | gohifeafar H SSIES B, T, BT gHTaeierdr BT
Jerarufard SUfe AT gD | vege,  weor, ofe, €y | WET AT ']
T (dfeerer) | wHwe iR aw iR S | IR (dfeerer)
guell @ 3rerf AgfTe oy AErge | IUTEl, UGk
GRI- T TeIfSiT a1 IUFRU & Frspder afiw [ SR AN @ qleror
ug SR ST HUEor ¥ =G (F9 W | §G  TGfeEW @R
amgufires  ufshamalt ®HH) 7 IY BT WA | g yonferdi @
W eTgfeE oiR (ii) 7 =rER wfkar oiR | &I SR WA
Se ¥, g o  ofpael, o | FEIRT wRTEg
Afe(Er), 2 fe ar qrTgaefeere) ol | TP BRI
g o EART arg g v @ e @ | SUPTL SR
3 fawpe & uRa g § v ¥ g | 9N 98 Uh S
I UIED g aRRr @, e gomeh o |ofET T
T BT APTE AT e @ wew | Aad B ER
RiepTg,  WRERTIA freaei frspy qx ugesy | O S SOl W
anfe oA | ¥ | B | Tadr & IR A

I ey W

Ugd D |

SICN N

% %k %k

NICERCERCENIGHIN]

feATdel Ucel WRAR




