
  

 

(Authoritative English text of this Department Notification No. Shram (A)3-4/2022 dated 15-
02, 2024 as required under clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India).  
  

      
            Government of Himachal Pradesh 
            Department of Labour &Employment 
             **** 
  

Shram (A)3-4/2022      Dated:  Shimla-171002,  the                                   15th February, 2024 
   
               NOTIFICATION 
                
     In exercise of the powers conferred by section 112 of Factories Act, 

1948 (Act No. 63 of 1948), the Governor, Himachal Pradesh proposes to make the following 

rules further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Factories Rules, 1950 notified vide Industries 

Department notification number D-80-12/48-III, dated 06.05.1952 and the same are hereby 

published in the Rajpatra (e-Gazette), Himachal Pradesh, for the information of general public, 

as required under section 115 of the said Act.  

If any person likely to be affected by these draft rules has any 

objection(s) or suggestion(s) in respect of these rules, he may send the same to the Labour 

Commissioner-cum-Chief Inspector of Factories, First Floor, New Himrus Building, Shimla-1, 

within 45 days from the date of its publication in Rajpatra(e-Gazette), Himachal Pradesh; 

The objection(s) or suggestion(s), if any, received within the 

above stipulated period shall be taken into consideration before finalizing the said rules, namely:-  

Short title and 

commencement 

1. (1) These rules may be called the Himachal 

Pradesh Factories (Amendment) Rules, 2024. 

(2) These rules shall come into force from the 

date of publication in the Rajpatra (e-Gazette), 

Himachal Pradesh. 

Amendment of rule 5 2. In the Himachal Pradesh Factories Rules, 1950 

(hereinafter referred to as the ‘said rules’), for the 

Schedule prescribed in sub-rule (2) of rule 5, the 

following shall be substituted, namely:-  

 

  

  



  

 

SCHEDULE 

Fee for grant of licence for a factory for one year 

Number of persons to be employed on any day during the year 

Quantity 
of Horse Power 
installed 
(Maximum 
Horse Power) 

Up 
to 09 

From 10 
to 20 

From 
21 to 

50 

From 
51 to 
100 

From 101 
to 250 

From 
251 to 

500 

From 
501 to 
1000 

From 
1001 to 

1500 

From 
1501 to 

2000 

Above 
2000 

Nil 730 1460 2190 2920 5840 8760 13140 17520 26280 35040 
Upto 20 1460 2190 2920 5840 8760 13140 17520 26280 35040 46720 
Exceeding 20 
but not 
exceeding 50 

2190 2920 5840 8760 13140 17520 26280 35040 46720 58400 

Exceeding 50 
but not 
exceeding 100 

2920 5840 8760 13140 17520 26280 35040 46720 58400 73000 

Exceeding 100 
but not 
exceeding 250 

- 8760 13140 17520 26280 35040 46720 58400 73000 81760 

Exceeding 250 
but not 
exceeding 500 

- 13140 17520 26280 35040 46720 58400 73000 81760 93440 

Exceeding 500 
but not 
exceeding 1000 

- 17520 26280 35040 46720 58400 73000 81760 93440 105120 

Exceeding 1000 
but not 
exceeding 1500 

- 26280 35040 46720 58400 73000 81760 93440 105120 116800 

Exceeding 1500 
but not 
exceeding 2000 

- 35040 46720 58400 73000 81760 93440 105120 116800 131400 

Exceeding 2000 
but not 
exceeding 3000 

- 46720 58400 73000 81760 93440 105120 116800 131400 146000 

Exceeding 3000 
but not 
exceeding 5000 

- 58400 73000 81760 93440 105120 116800 131400 146000 160600 

Exceeding 5000 
but not 
exceeding 7000 

- 73000 81760 93440 105120 116800 131400 146000 160600 175200 

Exceeding 7000 
but not 
exceeding 10000 

- 81760 93440 105120 116800 131400 146000 160600 175200 189800 

Exceeding 10000 
but not 
exceeding 15000 

- 93440 105120 116800 131400 146000 160600 175200 189800 204400 

Above 15000 - 105120 116800 131400 146000 160600 175200 189800 204400 219000 
 

 

 



  

 

Amendment of rule 6 3. In sub-rule (4) of rule 6 of the said rules, for the words 

“Rupees One hundred” the words “Rupees Five Hundred” 

shall be substituted.  

Amendment of rule 8 4. In rule 8 of said rules, in sub-rule (3), for the words “one 

hundred” the words “five hundred” shall be substituted. 

Amendment of rule 10 5. In rule 10 of said rules, for the words “one hundred” the 

words “five hundred” shall be substituted. 

Insertion of rule 12-A 6. After rule 12 of the said rules, the following rule shall 

be inserted, namely:- 

“12-A (1) The Chief Inspector may recognize any person 

as a ‘competent person’ within such area and for such 

period as may be specified for the purposes of 

carrying out tests, examinations, inspections and 

certification for such buildings, dangerous machinery, 

hoists and lifts, lifting machines and lifting tackles, 

pressure plant, confined space, ventilation system and 

such other process or plant and equipment as 

stipulated in the Act and the rules made thereunder, 

located in a factory, if such a person possesses the 

qualifications, experience and other requirements as 

set out in the SCHEDULE annexed to this rule: 

Provided that the Chief Inspector may relax 

the requirements of qualifications in respect of a 

competent person but concurrence of the State 

Government shall be taken and such a person after 

being so recognized, shall not have powers of an 

‘Inspector: 

Provided further that the competent person 

recognized under this provision shall not be above 

the age of 62 years and shall be physically fit for the 

purpose of carrying out the tests, examination and 

inspection. 

(1) The Chief Inspector may recognize an institution of 

repute, having persons possessing qualifications and 

experience as set out in the SCHEDULE annexed to 



  

 

this rule for the purpose of carrying out tests, 

examinations, inspections and certification for 

buildings, dangerous machinery, hoists and lifts, 

lifting machines and lifting tackles, pressure plant, 

confined space, ventilation system and such other 

process or plant and equipment as stipulated in the 

Act and the rules made thereunder as a competent 

person within such area and for such period as may 

be specified. 

(3) The Chief Inspector on receipt of an application in the 

Form prescribed under the rule from a person or an 

institution intending to be recognized as a competent 

person for the purposes of this Act and the rules 

made thereunder, shall register such application and 

within a period of sixty days of the date of receipt of 

application, either after having satisfied himself as 

regards competence and facilities available at the 

disposal of the applicant recognize the applicant as a 

competent person and issue a certificate of 

competency in the Form prescribed under this rule or 

reject the application specifying the reasons thereof. 

(4) The Chief Inspector may, after giving an opportunity 

to the competent person of being heard, revoke the 

certificate of competency,- 

(i) If he has reason to believe that a competent 

person,- 

(a) has violated any condition stipulated in the 

certificate of competency; or 

(b) has carried out a test, examination and 

inspection or has acted in a manner inconsistent 

with the intent or the purpose of this Act or the 

rules made thereunder; or has omitted to act as 

required under the Act and the rules made 

thereunder; or 

(ii) for any other reason to be recorded in writing. 



  

 

Explanation: For the purpose of this rule, an 

institution includes an organization. 

(5) The Chief Inspector may, for reasons to be recorded 

in writing, require re-certification of lifting 

machines, lifting tackles, pressure plant or 

ventilation system, as the case may be, which has 

been certified by a competent person outside the 

State. 

(6) Application for grant of certificate of competency 

shall be accompanied by a non-refundable fee of ₹ 

25,000 (Rupees Twenty Five Thousand) and a 

security amount (without interest) of ₹ 1,00,000/- 

(Rupees One Lakh) which shall be deposited in 

Major Head 0230-00-104-01 through HIMKOSH. 

(7) Application for renewal of Certificate of Competency 

shall be accompanied by a non-refundable fee of ₹ 

25,000/- (Rupees Twenty Five Thousand) which 

shall be deposited in the Major Head 0230-00-104-

01 through HIMKOSH  



  

 

  Form of application for grant of Certificate of 

Competency to a person under sub-rule (I) of rule 

12A. 

1. Name 

2. Date of Birth 

3. Name of the Organisation (if not self-employed) 

4. Designation 

5. Educational qualification (copies of testimonials to 

be attached) 

6. Details of professional experience (in chronological 

order) 

Name of the Organization     Period of Service    Designation    Area of Responsibility 

 

7. Membership, if any, of professional bodies 

8. (i) Details of facilities (examination, testing, 

etc.) at his disposal. 

(ii) Arrangements for calibrating and 

maintaining the accuracy of these facilities. 

9. Purpose for which Competency Certificate is 

sought (section or sections of the Act should be 

stated). 

10. Whether the applicant has been declared as a 

competent person under any statute (if so, the 

details) 

11. Any other relevant information. 

12. Declaration by the applicant. 

I, …………………., hereby declare that the information 

furnished above is true. I undertake:- 

(a) to maintain the facilities in good working order, 

calibrated periodically as per manufacturers 

instructions or as per National Standards; and 

(b) to fulfill and abide by all the conditions stipulated in 

the certificate of competency and instructions issued 

by the Chief Inspector from time to time. 

Place & 

Date                             Signature of the applicant : 



  

 

Declaration by the Institution (if employed) 

I, …………………., certify that Shri …………………… whose 

details are furnished above, is in our employment and 

nominate him on behalf of the organisation for the 

purposes of being declared as a competent person under 

the Act. I also undertake that I will,- 

(a) notify the Chief Inspector in case the competent 

person leaves our employment; 

(b) provide and maintain in good order all facilities at his 

disposal as mentioned above; 

(c) notify the Chief Inspector any change in the facilities 

(either addition or deletion) 

Signature 

Designation 

Telephone No. 

Official Seal 

Date:  

Form of Application for grant of Certificate of 

Competency to an Institution under sub-rule (2) of 

Rule 12A. 

1. Name and full address of the Organisation 

2. Organisation’s status (specify whether Government, 

Autonomous, Co-operative, Corporate or Private) 

3. Purpose for which Competency Certificate is sought 

(specify section(s) of the Act) 

4. Whether the Organisation has been declared as a 

competent person under this or any other statute. If so, 

give details. 

5. Particulars of persons employed and possessing 

qualification and experience as set out in Schedule 

annexed to rule 12A. 

6. Details of facilities and arrangements made for their 

maintenance and arrangements made for their 

maintenance and periodic calibration. 

7. Any other relevant information. 



  

 

8. Declaration: 

I, …………………….. hereby, on behalf of …………………. 

Certify that the details furnished above are correct to the 

best of my knowledge. I undertake to- 

(i) maintain the facilities in good working order, 

calibrated periodically as per manufacturers instructions 

or as per National Standards; and 

(ii) to fulfill and abide by all the conditions stipulated in 

the certificate of competency and instructions issued by 

the Chief Inspector from time to time. 

 

Signature of Head of the  

Institution or of the person  

authorised to sign on his behalf. 

 

Designation 

Place & Date 

 

Form of Certificate of Competency issued to a 

person or an institution in pursuance of rule 

12(A).  

 



  

 

I, ………………, Chief Inspector of Factories, Himachal 

Pradesh, Shimla, in exercise of the powers conferred on 

me under section 2(ca) of the Factories Act, 1948 and 

rules made thereunder hereby recognize 

………………………………… to be competent person 

for the purpose of carrying out tests, examinations, 

inspections and certifications of equipments under 

……………. which are used in a factory located in 

Himachal Pradesh under sections and rules mentioned 

below against competent person:- 

Name & Address of 

competent person/ 

institution 

Section/rules 

  

 

This certificate is valid upto  ………….. or the date, the 

Occupational Safety, Health and Working  Conditions 

Code, 2020 and rules made thereunder, shall come into 

force, whichever is earlier.  

This certificate is issued subject to the conditions 

stipulated hereunder. 

1. Tests, examinations and inspections shall be carried 

out in accordance with the provisions of the Act and 

the rules made thereunder, and record of tests shall 

be maintained in a register 

2. Tests, examination and inspection shall be carried 

out under direct supervision of the competent person 

and the date of test examination be informed to the 

Inspector i.e. Deputy Director Factories/ Assistant 

Director Factories under whose jurisdiction factory 

is located well in advance. Any testing without prior 

intimation as stated above shall not be accepted. 

3. The competent person shall procure all necessary 

equipments/facilities and maintain the same in good 

working order and inform to the Inspector i.e. 

Deputy Director Factories/ Assistant Director 



  

 

Factories under whose jurisdiction factory is located 

about the equipment used in testing work. 

4. Where maximum permissible working pressure is 

reduced or the examination shows that the pressure 

vessels or plant or any part thereof, cannot continue 

to be used safely unless certain repairs are carried 

out or unless any other safety measures are required 

to be taken the report shall be sent to concerned 

Inspector i.e. Deputy Director Factories/ Assistant 

Director Factories and copy of the same shall also 

be sent to the undersigned within 7 days of 

completion of the examination. 

5. The Institution recognized as competent person shall 

keep the undersigned informed about the name of the 

competent person who leave the organization. The 

certificate of competency issued shall stand 

cancelled if all of above named person(s) leave the 

organization. 

6. Monthly return shall be submitted covering names of 

Factories, list of equipments/vessels tested, date of 

test, number and date of certificate issued, working 

pressure or safe load allowed and special remarks if 

any by the 10th of every month. 

7. The Chief Inspector of Factories reserves the rights 

to revoke or amend this order at any time during its 

validity. 

8. The competent person shall take photographs and 

make recordings during the course of Tests, 

examinations and inspections and make it readily 

available as and when demanded by Chief Inspector 

of Factories. 

Application for renewal of competency certificate 

may be made at least one month before the expiry of 

this certificate 

Chief Inspector of Factories 
Shimla-1, Himachal Pradesh 



  

 

SCHEDULE 
 

Sr. 
No. 

 

Section or 
Rules under 
which 
competency is 
recognized 

Qualification 
required 

Experience for 
the purpose 

Facilities at 
his 
command 

1. 2. 3. 4. 5. 

1 

Rules made 
under Section 
6 and Section 
112 – 
Certificate of 
stability for 
buildings 

Degree in Civil 
or Structural 
Engineering; or 
equivalent 

i) A minimum of 
10 years 
experience in 
the design of 
construction 
or testing or 
repairs of 
structures; 

 ii) Knowledge 
of non-
destructive 
testing, 
various codes 
of practices 
that are 
current and 
the effect of 
the vibrations 
and natural 
forces on the 
stability of the 
building; and 

 iii) Ability to 
arrive at a 
reliable 
conclusion 
with regard to 
the safety of 
the structure 
or the 
building. 

 

2 

Rules made 
under Section 
21(2) – 
“Dangerous 
Machines” 

Degree in 
Electrical or 
Mechanical or 
Textile 
Engineering or 
equivalent. 

(i) a minimum of 
7 years 
experience in- 
a) design or 
operation or 
maintenance; or 
b) testing, 

examination 
and inspection 
of relevant 
machinery, 
their guards, 
safety devices 

Guages for 
measurement
; instruments 
for 
measurement 
of speed and 
any other 
equipment or 
device to 
determine the 
safety in the 
use of the 
dangerous 



  

 

and 
appliances. 

(ii) he shall –  
a) be conversant 

with safety 
devices and 
their proper 
functioning ; 

b) be able to 
identify 
defects and 
any other 
cause loading 
to failure; 
and) have 
ability to 
arrive at a 
reliable 
conclusion 
with regard to 
the proper 
functioning of 
safety device 
and appliance 
and machine 
guard. 

machines. 

3 
Section 28 – 
Hoists and 
Lifts 

A degree in 
Electrical and 
/or Mechanical 
Engineering or 
the equivalent 

(i) A minimum 
experience of 7 
years in- 
(a) design or 

erection or 
maintenance; 
or 

(b) inspection 
and test 
procedures of 
lifts and 
hoists; 

(ii) He shall be – 
(a) Conversant 

with relevant 
codes of 
practices and 
test procedures 
that are current; 

(b) Conversant 
with other 
statutory 
requirements 
conversing the 
safety of the 
Hoists and 
Lifts; 

Facilities for 
load testing, 
tensile 
testing, 
guages 
equipment/ 
gadgets for 
measurement 
and any other 
equipment 
required for 
determining 
the safe 
working 
conditions of 
Hoists and 
Lifts. 



  

 

(c) able to 
identify defects 
and arrive at a 
reliable 
conclusion with 
regard to the 
safety of Hoists 
and Lifts. 

4 

Section 29 – 
Lifting 
Machinery and 
Lifting Tackles 

Degree in 
Mechanical or 
Electrical or 
Metallurgical 
Engineering or 
its equivalent 

(i) A minimum 
experience of 7 
years in- 
(a) design or 
erection or 
maintenance; or 
(b) testing, 
examination and 
inspection, of 
lifting 
machinery, 
chains, ropes 
and lifting 
tackles. 
(ii) He shall be – 
(a) Conversant 
with the 
relevant codes 
of practices and 
test procedures 
that are current; 

(b) Conversant 
with fracture 
mechanics and 
metallurgy of 
the material of 
construction; 

(c) Conversant 
with heat 
treatment/ 
stress relieving 
techniques as 
applicable to 
stress bearing 
components 
and parts of 
lifting 
machinery and 
lifting tackles; 

(d) capable of 
identifying 
defects and 
arriving at a 
reliable 
conclusion with 

Facilities for 
load testing, 
tensile 
testing, heat 
treatment, 
equipment/ 
gadget for 
measurement, 
gauges and 
such other 
equipment to 
determine the 
safe working 
conditions of 
the lifting 
machinery 
tackle. 



  

 

regard to the 
safety of lifting 
machinery, 
chains, ropes, 
and lifting 
tackles. 

5 
Section 31 –
‘Pressure Plant 

Degree in 
Chemical or 
Electrical or 
Metallurgical or 
Mechanical 
Engineering or 
its equivalent. 

(i) A minimum 
experience of 
10 years in- 

(a) design or 
erection or 
maintenance, or 

(b) testing,  
examination 
and inspection 
of pressure 
plants. 

(ii) He shall be– 
(a) Conversant 

with the 
relevant codes 
of practices and 
test procedures 
relating to 
pressure 
vessels; 

(b) Conversant 
with statutory 
requirements 
concerning the 
safety of 
unfired pressure 
vessels and 
equipment 
operating under 
pressure; 

(c) Conversant 
with non-
destructive 
testing 
techniques as 
are applicable 
to pressure 
vessels; 

(d) able to 
identify defects 
and arrive at a 
reliable 
conclusion with 
regard to the 
safety of 
pressure plants. 

Facilities for 
carrying out 
hydraulic 
test, non-
destructive 
test, gauges 
equipment/ 
gadgets for 
measurement 
and any other 
equipment or 
gauges to 
determine the 
safety in use 
of pressure 
vessels. 



  

 

6 

(i) Section 36 
–Precautions 
against 
dangerous 
fumes(ii) 
Rules made 
under sections 
41 and 112 
concerning 
ship-building 
and ship 
repairs, 
Handling and 
processing of 
asbestos, 
Manufacture 
of Rayon by 
viscose 
process, 
Foundry 
operations. 

Masters degree 
in Chemistry, 
or a degree in 
Chemical 
Engineering. 

(i) a minimum of 
7 years in 
collection and 
analysis of 
environmental 
samples and 
calibration of 
monitoring 
equipment;(ii) 
He shall – 

(a) be conversant 
with the 
hazardous 
properties of 
chemicals and 
their 
permissible 
limit values; 
(b) be 
conversant with 
the current 
techniques of 
sampling and 
analysis of the 
environmental 
contaminants; 
and  

(c) be able to 
arrive at a 
reliable 
conclusion as 
regards the 
safety in 
respect of 
entering and 
carrying out hot 
work. 

Meters, 
instruments 
and devices 
duly 
calibrated 
and certified 
for carrying 
out the tests 
and 
certification 
of safety in 
working in 
confined 
spaces. 

7 

Ventilation 
systems as 
required under 
various 
Schedules 
framed under 
section 87, 
such as 
Schedules on 
Grinding or 
glazing or 
metals and 
processes and 
incidental 
thereto, 
Cleaning or 

Degree in 
Mechanical or 
Electrical 
Engineering or 
equivalent. 

(i) A minimum of 
7 years in the 
design, 
fabrication, 
installation, 
testing of 
ventilation 
system and 
systems used 
for extraction 
and collection 
of dusts, fumes 
and vapours and 
other ancillary 
equipment.  

(ii) He shall be 

Facilities for 
testing the 
ventilation 
system, 
instruments 
and gauges 
for testing the 
effectiveness 
of the 
extraction 
systems for 
dusts, 
vapours and 
fumes, and 
any other 
equipment 



  

 

smoothing, 
roughening, 
etc. of articles, 
by a jet sand, 
metal shot, or 
grit, or other 
abrasive 
propelled by a 
blast of 
compressed air 
of steam. 

conversant with 
relevant codes 
of practice and 
tests procedures 
that are current 
in respect of 
ventilation and 
a traction 
system for 
fumes, and 
shall be able to 
arrive at a 
reliable 
conclusion with 
regard to 
effectiveness of 
the system. 

needed for 
determining 
the efficiency 
and adequacy 
of these 
systems. He 
shall have the 
assistance of 
a suitable 
qualified 
technical 
person who 
can come to a 
reasonable 
conclusion as 
to the 
adequacy of 
the system. 

 
 

        By order, 

             Secretary (Lab. & Emp.) to the  
                                   Government of Himachal Pradesh. 
 
    **** 
  



  

 

 
  fgekpy çns”k ljdkj  
  Je ,oa jkstxkj foHkkx 

                                    **** 
la[;k Je ¼,½ 3&4@2022   rkjh[k       f“keyk&171002]         15 Qjojh- 2024 

                           izk#i vf/klwpuk  

fgekpy çns“k ds jkT;iky] dkj[kkuk vf/kfu;e] 1948 ¼1948 dk vf/kfu;e 

la[;kad 63½ dh /kkjk 112 }kjk iznÙk “kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq,] m|ksx foHkkx dh  vf/klwpuk 

la[;k Mh&80&12@48&III] rkjh[k 06&05&1952 dks vf/klwfpr vkSj izdkf”kr fgekpy çns“k 

dkj[kkuk fu;e] 1950 dk vkSj la”kks/ku djus ds fy, fuEufyf[kr fu;e cukus dk izLrko djrs gSa 

vkSj mUgsa mDr vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 115 ds v/khu ;Fkk visf{kr tu lk/kkj.k dh lwpuk ds fy, 

jkti= ¼bZ&xtV½] fgekpy çns“k esa ,rn~}kjk izdkf”kr fd;k tkrk gS(    

 bu izk#i fu;eksa }kjk laHkkO; izHkkfor gksus okys fdlh O;fDr ds ;fn bu 

fu;eksa dh ckcr dksbZ vk{ksi ;k lq>ko gS@gSa] rks og@ os mUgsa mDr izk#i fu;eksa ds jkti= 

¼bZ&xtV½] fgekpy çns“k esa izdk”ku dh rkjh[k ls iSarkfyl fnu dh vof/k ds Hkhrj Je 

vk;qDr&,ao&eq[; dkj[kkuk fujh{kd] izFke ry] U;w fgejl Hkou] f”keyk&1 dks Hkst ldsxk@ ldsaxsA 

   mijksDr fu;r vof/k ds Hkhrj izkIr vk{ksi ;k lq>ko] ;fn dksbZ gks@gksa ij mDr fu;eksa dks 

vafre #i nsus ls iwoZ fopkj esa fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%&  

1- laf{kIr uke vkSj izkjaHk-& ¼1½ bu fu;eksa dk laf{kIr uke fgekpy izns”k dkj[kkuk ¼la”kks/ku½ fu;e] 

2024 gSA 

¼2½ ;s fu;e jkti= ¼bZ&xtV½] fgekpy çns“k esa izdk”ku dh rkjh[k ls izo`Ÿk gksaxsA   

2- fu;e 5 dk la”kks/ku-& fgekpy çns“k dkj[kkuk fu;e] 1950 ¼ftUgsa blesa blds i”pkr~ ^mDr 

fu;e* dgk x;k gS½ ds fu;e 5 ds mi fu;e ¼2½ esa fofgr muqlwph ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk 

tk,xk] vFkkZr~& 

       

     

 

 

       

  



  

 

vuqlwph 

dkj[kkus ds fy, ,d o’kZ ds fy, vuqKfIr iznku djus gsrq “kqYd 

o’kZ ds nkSjku fdlh Hkh fnu fu;ksftr fd, tkus okys O;fDr;ksa dh vf/kdre la[;k 
LFkkfir gkWlZ 
ikoj dh ek=k 
¼vf/kdre gkWlZ 
ikoj½ 

09 
rd 

10 ls 
20 rd 

21 ls 
50 rd 

51 ls 
100 
rd 

101 ls 
250 rd 

251 ls 
500 rd 

501 ls 
1000 
rd 

1001 ls 
1500 
rd 

1501 ls 
2000 
rd 

2000 ls 
Åij 

”kqU;  730 1460 2190 2920 5840 8760 13140 17520 26280 35040 

 20  rd 1460 2190 2920 5840 8760 13140 17520 26280 35040 46720 

20 ls vf/kd 
ijarq 50 ls 
vf/kd ugha 

2190 2920 5840 8760 13140 17520 26280 35040 46720 58400 

50  vf/kd 
ijarq 100 ls 
vf/kd ugha 

2920 5840 8760 13140 17520 26280 35040 46720 58400 73000 

100 ls vf/kd 
ijarq 250 ls 
vf/kd ugha  

- 8760 13140 17520 26280 35040 46720 58400 73000 81760 

250  vf/kd 
ijarq 500 ls 
vf/kd ugha 

- 13140 17520 26280 35040 46720 58400 73000 81760 93440 

500 ls vf/kd 
ijarq 1000 ls 
vf/kd ugha 

- 17520 26280 35040 46720 58400 73000 81760 93440 105120 

1000 ls vf/kd 
ijarq 1500 ls 
vf/kd ugha 

- 26280 35040 46720 58400 73000 81760 93440 105120 116800 

1500 ls vf/kd 
ijarq 2000 ls 
vf/kd ugha 

- 35040 46720 58400 73000 81760 93440 105120 116800 131400 

2000 ls vf/kd 
ijarq 3000 ls 
vf/kd ugha 

- 46720 58400 73000 81760 93440 105120 116800 131400 146000 

3000 ls vf/kd 
ijarq 5000 ls 
vf/kd ugha 

- 58400 73000 81760 93440 105120 116800 131400 146000 160600 

5000 ls vf/kd 
ijarq 7000 ls 
vf/kd ugha 

- 73000 81760 93440 105120 116800 131400 146000 160600 175200 

7000 ls vf/kd 
ijarq 10]000 ls 
vf/kd ugha 

- 81760 93440 105120 116800 131400 146000 160600 175200 189800 

10]000 ls 
vf/kd ijarq 
15]000 ls 
vf/kd ugha 

- 93440 105120 116800 131400 146000 160600 175200 189800 204400 

15]000 ls 
vf/kd 

- 105120 116800 131400 146000 160600 175200 189800 204400 219000 



  

 

fu;e 6 dk la”kks/ku 3 mDr fu;eksa ds fu;e 6 ds mi fu;e ¼4½ esa **,d lkS** 

“kCnksa ds LFkku ij **ikap lkS** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 

fu;e 8 dk la”kks/ku 4 mDr fu;eksa ds fu;e 8 ds mi fu;e ¼3½ esa] **,d lkS** 

“kCnksa ds LFkku ij **ikap lkS** “kCn j[ks tk,saxsA 

fu;e 10 dk la”kks/ku 5 mDr fu;eksa ds fu;e 10 esa] **,d lkS** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij 

**ikap lkS** “kCn j[ks tk,saxsA 

fu;e 12 d dk vUr%LFkkiu-& 6 mDr fu;eksa ds fu;e 12 ds i”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr fu;e 

vUr%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr-& 

  **12 d-& ¼1½ eq[; fujh{kd fdlh O;fDr dks ,sls {ks= esa 

vkSj ,slh vof/k] tSlh ,sls Hkouksa] [krjukd e”khujh] 

mŸkksyd vkSj fy¶V] fyf¶Vax e”khu vkSj fyf¶Vax VSdy] 

izS”kj IykaV] flfer LFkku] okrkuqdqyu iz.kkyh vkSj 

dkj[kkuk esa vofLFkr ,slh vU; izfØ;k ;k la;= vkSj 

miLdj ¼midj.k½ tSls vf/kfu;e vkSj rn~/khu cuk, x, 

fu;eksa esa fofgr gS] gsrq ijh{k.k] ijh{kk ¼tkap½] fujh{k.k vkSj 

izek.ku dk;kZfUor djus ds iz;kstu gsrq fofufnZ’V dh tk,] 

*l{ke O;fDr* ds #i esa ekU;rk ns ldsxk] ;fn ,slk dksbZ 

O;fDr bl fu;e ls layXu vuqlwfp esa ;Fkk fu/kkZfjr 

vgZrk,a] vuqHko vkSj vU; vis{kk,a j[krk gks( 

ijUrq eq[; fujh{kd *l{ke O;fDr* ds laca/k esa 

vgZrkvksa dh vis{kkvksa esa NwV ns ldsxk] fdarq jkT; ljdkj 

dh lgefr yh tk,xh vkSj ,sls O;fDr ds ikl bl izdkj 

ekU;rk izkIr gksus ds i”pkr~] fujh{kd dh “kfDr;ka ugha 

gksxh(   

ijarq ;g vkSj fd bl mica/k ds v/khu 

ekU;rk izkIr *l{ke O;fDr* dh vk;q 62 o’kZ ls vf/kd ugha 

gksxh vkSj og ijh{k.k] ijh{kk vkSj fujh{k.k dk;kZfUor djus 

ds iz;kstu gsrq “kkjhfjd #i ls LoLFk gksxkA 

¼2½ eq[; fujh{kd fdlh izfrf’Br laLFkku dks bl fu;e ls 

layXu vuqllwph esa ;Fkk fu/kkZfjr vgZrkvksa vkSj vuqHko 

j[kus okys O;fDr;ksa dks ,sls Hkouksa [krjukd e”khujh] 

mŸkksyd vkSj fy¶V] fyf¶Vax e”khu vkSj fyf¶Vax VSdy] 

izS”kj IykaV] flfer LFkku] okrkuqdqyu iz.kkyh rFkk 



  

 

vf/kfu;e vkSj rn~/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa esa ;Fkkfu/kkZfjr 

fofgr ,slh vU; izfØ;k ;k la;= vkSj midj.k ¼miLdj½ 

gsrq ijh{k.k] ijh{kk] fujh{k.k vkSj izek.ku dk;kZfUor djus 

ds iz;kstu gsrq ,sls {ks= esa vkSj ,slh vof/k] tSlh fofgr 

dh tk,] ds fy, l{ke O;fDr ds #i esa ekU;rk iznku dj 

ldsxkA 

¼3½ eq[; fujh{kd] bl vf/kfu;e vkSj rn~/khu cuk, x, 

fu;eksa ds iz;kstu ds fy, *l{ke O;fDr* ds #i esa ekU;rk 

izkIr djus ds fy, vk”kf;r fdlh O;fDr ;k fdlh laLFkk 

ls bl fu;e ds v/khu fofgr iz#i esa vkosnu izkIr gksus 

ij ,sls vkosnu dks jftLVªhd̀r djsxk vkSj vkosnu izkIr 

gksus dh rkjh[k ls lkB fnu dh vof/k ds Hkhrj ;k rks 

vkosnd dh {kerk vkSj miyC/k izlqfo/kkvksa ds laca/k esa Loa; 

dk lek/kku gksus ds i”pkr~ vkosnd dks ,d *l{ke O;fDr* 

ds #i esa ekU;rk nsxk vkSj bl fu;e ds v/khu fofgr 

iz#i esa ^l{kerk izek.k i=^ tkjh djsxk ;k dkj.kksa dks 

fofufnZ’V djrs gq, vkosnu dks vLohdkj djsxkA 

¼4½ eq[; fujh{kd] l{ke O;fDr dks lquokbZ dk volj 

iznku djus ds i”pkr~] l{kerk dk izek.k&e= izfrlaâr 

dj ldsxk]& 

¼i½ ;fn mlds fo”okl dk ;g dkj.k gS fd l{ke O;fDr 

us]&  

¼d½ *l{kerk izek.ki=* esa fofgr fdlh Hkh “krZ dk 

mYya?ku fd;k gS(  ;k 

¼[k½ bl vf/kfu;e ;k rn~/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa ds iz;kstu 

ds fy, dksbZ] ijh{k.k] ijh{kk vkSj fujh{k.k dk;kZfUor fd;k 

gS ;k ,sls vk”k; ls vlaxr fdlh jhfr ls dk;Z fd;k gS 

vFkok bl vf/kfu;e vkSj rn~/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa ds 

v/khu ;Fkk visf{kr fdlh dk;Z dk yksi fd;k gS( ;k 

 ¼ii½ fyf[kr esa vfHkfyf[kr fd, tkus ds fdlh vU; 

dkj.k ds fy,A 

Li’Vhdj.k% bl fu;e ds iz;kstu ds fy,] laLFkk ds 

vUrxZr laxBu Hkh gSA 



  

 

¼5½ eq[; fujh{kd] dkj.kksa dks fyf[kr esa vfHkfyf[kr djds] 

;FkkfLFkfr] fyf¶Vax e”khuksa] fyf¶Vax VSdy] izS”kj IykaV ;k 

okrkuqdqyu iz.kkyh ds iqu% izek.khdj.k] ftls jkT; ds 

ckgj fdlh l{ke O;fDr }kjk izekf.kr fd;k x;k gS dh 

vis{kk dj ldsxkA 

¼6½ l{kerk izek.k i= iznku djus gsrq vkosnu] #0 

25000@& ¼iPphl gtkj #i;s½ dh vizfrns; Qhl vkSj 

#0 100]000@& ¼,d yk[k #i;s½ dh C;kt jfgr izfrns; 

izfrHkwfr jde ds lkFk fd;k tk,xk] ftls fgedks’k ds 

ek/;e ls eq[; “kh’kZ 0230&00&104&01 esa tek fd;k 

tk,xkA 

¼7½ l{kerk izek.k&i= ds uohuhdj.k ds fy, vkosnu #0 

25000@& ¼iPphl gtkj #i;s½ dh vizfrns; Qhl ds 

lkFk fd;k tk,xk] ftls fgedks’k ds ek/;e ls eq[; “kh’kZ 

0230&00&104&01 esa tek fd;k tk,xkA 

             

  



  

 

fu;e 12 ¼v½ ds mi&fu;e ¼1½ ds v/khu fdlh O;fDr dks l{kerk izek.k i= iznku djus ds fy, vkosnu 

i= dk iz#i 

1 Ukke 

2 tUe frfFk 

3  laxBu dk uke ¼;fn] Lofu;ksftr u gks½ 

4 inuke 

5 “kS{kf.kd vgZrk ¼”kalki= dh izfr;ka layXu dh tk,a½ 

6 O;kolkf;d ¼òfŸkd½ vuqHko ds C;kSjs ¼dkykuqØfed Øe esa½ 

laxBu dk uke         lsok dh vof/k          Iknuke              ¼drZO; dk {ks=½ 

    

7 O;kolkf;d fudk;ksa dh lnL;rk] ;fn dksbZ gksA 

8 ¼i½ mlds fuiVku esa izlqfo/kkvksa ¼ijh{kk] ijh{k.k vkfn½ dk fooj.kA 

¼ii½ bu izlqfo/kkvksa dh lVhdrk dk va”k”kks/ku djus vkSj vuqj{k.k djus dh O;oLFkk djukA  

9 iz;kstu ftlds fy, l{kerk izek.ki= ekaxk x;k gS ¼vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk ;k /kkjkvksa dk mYys[k fd;k 

tk,½A 

10 D;k vkosnd dks fdlh ifjfu;e ¼LVsV~;wV½ ds v/khu l{ke O;fDr ds #i esa ?kksf’kr fd;k x;k gS ¼;fn 

,slk gks rks C;kSjs½A  

11 dksbZ vU; lqlaxr lwpukA 

12 vkosnd }kjk ?kks’k.kkA 

eSa] ------------------------------------- ,rn~}kjk ?kks’k.kk djrk gw¡ fd Åij nh xbZ lwpuk lR; gSA eSa opu nsrk gw¡ %& 

 ¼d½ fofuekZrk ds funsZ”kksa ds vuqlkj ;k jk’Vªh; ekudksa ds vuqlkj izlqfo/kkvksa dks lgh gkykr esa 

¼lqO;ofLFkr dk;Zpkyu½ esa vuqjf{kr djuk] ,oa dkfydr% va”k”kks/ku djuk] vkSj  

 ¼[k½ l{kerk izek.k i= esa fofgr leLr “krksZa dk vuqikyu djuk vkSj eq[; fujh{kd }kjk 

le;&le; ij tkjh funsZ”kksa dks iw.kZ djukA   

 LFkku ------------------------------------------- vkosnd ds gLrk{kj  

 vkSj 
rkjh[k 

---------------------------------------  

 laLFkk }kjk ?kks’k.kk ¼;fn fu;ksftr@dk;Zjr gks½ 

eSa] ------------------------------------------------------------------ izekf.kr djrk gw¡ fd Jh--------------------------------------------------------- ftudk 

fooj.k Åij fn;k x;k gS] gekjs fu;kstu esa gS vkSj mls vf/kfu;e ds v/khu ,d l{ke O;fDr ?kksf’kr 

fd, tkus ds iz;kstu gsrq laxBu dh vksj ls bl in ij ukefufnZ’V djrk gw¡A eSa ;g Hkh opu nsrk 

gw¡ fd]& 

 ¼d½ ;fn l{ke O;fDr gekjk fu;kstu NksM+ nsrk gS rks eq[; fujh{kd dks lwfpr djuk( 



  

 

 ¼[k½ mlds fuiVku ij mijksDr ;Fkkof.kZr leLr izlqfo/kk,a iznku djuk vkSj lqO;oLFkk cuk, 

j[kuk( 

 ¼x½ Ikzlqfo/kkvksa esa dksbZ ifjorZu ¼c<+kuk ;k gVk fn;k tkuk½ eq[; fujh{kd dks lwfpr djukA 

  gLrk{kj 

  Iknuke 

  nqjHkk’k la[;k 

  izkf/kdkfjd eksgj 

  Rkkjh[k% 

 fu;e 12&v ds mi&fu;e ¼2½ ds v/khu fdlh laLFkku dks l{kerk izek.k&i= iznku djus ds fy, 

vkosnu i=A   

 1 laxBu dk uke vkSj iwjk irk 

 2 laxBu dh gSfl;r ¼fufnZ’V djsa fd D;k ljdkjh] Lok;Ÿk] lgdkjh] fuxfer ;k futh gS½ 

 3 iz;kstu ftlds fy, l{kerk izek.k&i= ekaxk x;k gS ¼vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk,a fufnZ’V djsa½ 

 4 D;k laxBu dks bl ;k fdlh vU; fof/k ds v/khu l{ke O;fDr ?kksf’kr fd;k x;k gSA ;fn gka] 

rks fooj.k nsaA 

 5 fu;e 12 v ls layXu vuqlwph esa fn, x, ds vuqlkj fu;ksftr vkSj vgZrk j[kus okys O;fDr;ksa 

dh fof”kf’V;kaA 

 6 muds vuqj{k.k ds fy, dh xbZ O;oLFkkvksa dk fooj.k vkSj muds vuqj{k.k vkSj dkfydr% 

v”kkadu ds fy, dh xbZ O;oLFkk,aA 

 7 dksbZ vU; lqlaxr lwpukA 

 8 ?kks’k.kk%& 

    eSa ------------------------------- ,rn}kjk ---------------------------------- dh vksj ls iz.kkf.kr djrk gw¡ fd 

mijksDRk nh xbZ tkudkjh esjh tkudkjh ds vuqlkj lgh gSA 

eS-& 

¼i½ fuekZrk ds funsZ”kksa ;k jk’Vªh; ekudksa ds vuqlkj izlqfo/kkvksa dh lgh gkyr esa lqO;ofLFkr 

dk;Zpkyu vuqjf{kr djus vkSj dkfydr% va”kkdu djus( vkSj  

¼ii½ l{kerk izek.k i= esa fofufnZ’V lHkh “krksZa vkSj eq[; fujh{kd }kjk le;&le; ij tkjh 

“krksZa dks iw.kZ djus vkSj vuqikyuk djus dk opu nsrk gw¡A  

LFkku vkSj rkjh[k ------------------------------                    LkaLFkku ds izeq[k ;k bl fufer 

               vf/kd`r O;fDr ds gLrk{kjA 

                                   inuke-------------------------  

fu;e 12 ¼v½ ds vuqlj.k es fdlh O;fDr ;k laLFkk dks tkjh l{kerk izEkk.k&i= dk izk:i 

 



  

 

 eSa ----------------------------- eq[; dkj[kkuk fujh{kd] fgekpy izns”k] f”keyk dkj[kkuk vf/kfu;e] 1948 

dh /kkjk 2 ¼x d½ vkSj rn~/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa }kjk eq>s iznŸk “kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq, ----

---------------------------- dks ,rn~}kjk ----------------------- ds v/khu midj.kksa tks fgekpy izns”k esa vofLFkr 

dkj[kkus esa iz;ksx fd, tk jgs gSa dh tkap] ijh{k.k] fujh{k.k vkSj izek.ku dk;kZfUor djus ds 

iz;kstu ds fy, l{ke O;fDr ds uke ds lekus n”kkZbZ xbZ /kkjkvksa vkSj fu;eksa ds v/khu l{ke 

O;fDr gksus dh ekU;rk nsrk g¡w%&    
  Lk{ke O;fDr@  laLFkku dk uke vkSj irk  /kkjk @ fu;e  

  

  

  

  
 

 
;g izek.k i= --------------------------------------- rd ;k ml rkjh[k ftldks O;olkf;d lqj{kk] LokLF; vkSj 

dk;Zn”kk,a lafgrk] 2020 vkSj rn~/khu cuk, x, fu;e izo`Ÿk gkasxss] tks Hkh iwoZrj gks] fof/kekU; gSA  

;g izek.k= mlds uhps fu;r “krksZa ds v/;/khu tkjh fd;k x;k gSA 

1- tk¡p] ijh{k.k vkSj fujh{k.k bl vf/kfu;e vkSj rn~/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa ds mica/kksa ds vuqlkj fd, 

tk,axs vkSj ijh{k.kksa dk vfHkys[k jftLVj esa vuqjf{kr fd;k tk,xkA 

2- tk¡p] ijh{k.k vkSj fujh{k.k l{ke O;fDr ds lh/ks Ik;Zos{k.k ds v/khu fd, tk,axs vkSj fujh{kd vFkkZr~ 

mi funs”kd dkj[kkuk@ lgk;d funs”kd dkj[kkuk] ftldh vf/kdkfjrk esa dkj[kkuk vofLFkr gS] dks 

tk¡p@ ijh{k.k dh rkjh[k vfxze :i ls lwfpr dh tk,xhA midZfFkr iwoZ lwpuk ds fCkuk dksbZ Hkh 

ijh{k.k Lohd`r ugha fd;k tk,xkA  

3- l{ke O;fDr lHkh vko”;d midj.kksa@ lqfo/kkvksa dks mIkkIr djsxk vkSj bldks lgh gkyr esa 

¼lqO;ofLFkr dk;Z pkyu½ vuqjf{kr djsXkk vkSj fujh{kd vFkkZr~ mi funs”kd dkj[kkuk@ lgk;d 

funs”kd dkj[kkuk] ftldh vf/kdkfjrk esa dkj[kkuk vofLFkr gS] dks ijh{k.k dk;Z esa mi;ksx fd, x, 

midj.kksa ds ckjs esa lwfpr djsxk A  

4- Tkgk¡ vf/kdre vuqKkr dk;Zpkyu nckc {kh.k gks x;k gS ;k ijh{kk ls nf”kZr gksrk gS fd nCkkCk ik= ;k 

l;a= ;k bldk dksbZ Hkkx] tc rd dfri; ejEer ugha dh tkrh vFkok tCk rd dksbZ vU; lqj{kk 

mik; visf{kr ugha fd, tkrs] rc rd mldk mi;ksx lqjf{kr :Ik ls tkjh ugha j[k ldrsA bldh 

fjiksVZ lEc} fujh{kd  vFkkZr~ mi funs”kd dkj[kkuk@ lgk;d funs”kd dkj[kkuk dks Hksth tk,xh 

vkSj bldh ,d izfr ijh{kk iw.kZ gksus ds lkr fnu ds Hkhrj v/kksgLrk{kjh dks Hkh Hksth tk,xhA  



  

 

5- l{ke O;fDr ds :Ik esa ekU;rk izkIr LkaLFkk] laxBu NksM+us okys l{ke O;fDr ds uke ds ckjs esa 

v/kksgLrk{kjh dks lwfpr djsXkhA ;fn miukZfer lEkLr O;fDr laxBr dkss NksM+ nsrs gSa rks tkjh fd;k 

x;k Lk{kerk izek.k&i= j} gqvk le>k tk,xkA  

6- gj eghus dh 10 rkjh[k rd dkj[kkuksa ds ukeksa] ijh{k.k fd, x, midj.kksa@  ik=ksa dh lwph] ijh{k.k 

dh rkjh[k] tkjh fd, x, izek.k i= dh la[;k vkSj rkjh[k] dk;Zpkyu ncko ;k vuqKkr lqjf{kr Hkkj 

vkSj fo”ks’k fVIif.k;ka] ;fn dksbZ gks] dks LkfEefyr djrs gq, ekfld fooj.kh izLrqr dh tk,xhA  

7- eq[; dkj[kkuk fujh{kd ds ikl bl vkns”k dks bldh OkS/krk ds nkSjku fdlh Hkh le; izfrlaâr djus 

;k la”kks/ku djus ds vf/kdkj lqjf{kr gksaxsA 

8- ijh{k.kksa] ijh{kkvksa vkSj fujh{k.kksa ds nkSjku Lk{ke O;fDr QksVksxzkQ ysXkk vkSj fjdkfMZax djsxk vkSj eq[; 

dkj[kkuk fujh{kd }kjk tc ekaxk tk, rks bldks lgtrk ls miyC/k djok,xkA 

Lk{kerk izek.k i= ds uohdj.k ds fy, vkosnu bl izek.k i= ds volku ls de ls de ,d ekl iwoZ 

fd;k tk,xkA  

        Ekq[; dkj[kkuk fujh{kd   
         fgekpy izns”k f”keyk&1                               

 
  



  

 

vuqlwph 
 

dze 
la[;k  
 

/kkjk ;k fu;e ftlds  
v/khu l{kerk dks 
ekU;rk nh xbZ  

 visf{kr  vgZrk  Ikz;kstu ds fy, vuqHko  izlqqfo/kk,a tks mlds 
fu;a=.k esa gSA  

1- /kkjk 6 vkSj /kkjk 112 
ds v/khu cuk, x, 
fu;e & Hkouksa gsrq 
fLFkjrk izek.k&i=  

 

flfoy ;k 
lajpukRed 
bathfu;fjax esa 
mikf/k ;k mlds 
led{kA 

 

¼i½ Lkajpukvksa ds fuekZ.k ds 
fMtkbu ;k ijh{k.k ;k 
ejEer esa U;qure 10 o’kZ 
dk vuqHko(  

¼ii½xSj&fouk”kdjh ijh{k.k] 
fofHkUu O;ogkj lafgrk,a] 
tks izpfyr@ fo|eku gSa] 
vkSj Hkou dh fLFkjrk ij 
daiu vkSj izkdf̀rd 
“kfDr;ksa ds izHkko dk 
Kku( vkSj  

¼iii½ lajpuk ;k Hkou  dh 
lqj{kk ds laca/k esa 
fo”oluh; fu’d’kZ ij 
igq¡pus dh {kerkA 

 

2- /kkjk 21¼2½ ds v/khu 
cuk, x, fu;e 
**[krjukd e”khusa** 

bYksfDVªdy ;k 
eSdsfudy ;k 
diM+k ¼VssDl 
VkbZy½  
bathfu;fjax esa 
mikf/k ;k mlds 
led{kA  

¼i½ ¼d½ fMtkbUk ;k lapkyu 
;k vuqj{k.k ;k  
¼[k½ lqlaxr e”khujh ds 

midj.kksa dh ijh{kk]  
ijh{k.k vkSj fujh{k.k esa 
de ls de 7¼lkr½ o’kZ 
dk vuqHko& 

¼ii½ og-&  
¼d½ lqj{kk midj.kksa vkSj 
mudh leqfpr dk;Ziz.kkyh 
ls vo”; voxr gks ( 

¼[k½ =qfV;ksa dh vkSj yksfMax 
ds foQy jgus ds fdlh 
vU; dkj.k dh igpku 
djus esa l{ke gksa vkSj 
e”khu lqj{kk] lqj{kk 
midj.k rFkk miLdj ds 
mfpr dk;Zikyu ds lac/k 
esa fo”olUkh; fu’d’kZ ij 
igqapus dh {kerk j[krk 
gksA 

Ekki ds fy, xst 
xfr ekius gsrq 
midj.k vkSj 
[krjukd e”khuksa ds 
mi;ksx es lqj{kk 
fu/kkZfjr djus gsrq 
visf{kr dksbZ vU; 
midj.kA 
 

3 /kkjk 28 & mŸkksyd 
vkSj fy¶V 

bysfDVªªªªdy vkSj@ 
;k eSdsfudy 

¼i½ ¼d½ fMtkbu ;k fuekZ.k 
;k j[kj[kko( ¼vuqj{k.k½ 

yksM ijh{k.k] Rkuko 
ijh{k.k eki ds fy, 



  

 

bathfu;fjax esa 
mikf/k ;k led{kA 

vFkok 
¼[k½ fy¶Vksa vkSj mŸkksydksa 
dh fujh{k.k vkSj ijh{k.k 
izfd;kvksa esa de ls de 
7 o’kZ dk vuqHko 

¼ii½ ¼d½ og& 
lqlaxr O;oLFkk lfgarkvksa 
vkSj ijh{k.k izfØ;kvksa] tks 
izpfyr gSa ls ifjfpr gksa(  

¼[k½ mŸkksyd vkSj fy¶Vksa 
dh lqj{kk ls lacf/kr vU; 
OkS/kkfud vis{kkvksa ls 
voxr gks(  

¼x½ =qfVvksa dh igpku djus  
vkSj mŸkksyd  vkSj fy¶Vksa 
dh lqj{kk ds laca/k esa 
fo”oluh; fu’d’kZ ij 
igqapus esa l{ke gksA   

RkU;rk ijh{k.k xsTk 
midj.k@ ;U= vkSj 
mŸkksyd  vkSj fy¶Vksa 
dh lqjf{kr dk;Zn”kk 
dks fu/kkZfjr djus 
gsrq visf{kr fdlh Hkh 
vU; midi.k gsrq 
izlqfo/kk,a A 

4 /kkjk 29 fyf¶Vax 
e”khu vkSj fyf¶Vax 
VSdy 

esSdsfudy ;k 
bySDVªhdy  ;k 
/kkrq foKku 
¼esVyftZdy½  
bathfu;fjax esa 
mikf/k ;k 
blds led{kA  

¼i½ ¼d½ fMtkbu ;k fuekZ.k 
;k j[kj[kko ¼vuqj{k.k½] ;k( 
 ¼[k½ fyf¶Vax e”khujh] 

tathjksa]  jfLl;ksa vkSj 
fyf¶Vax VSdy dh 
ijh{kk] ijh{k.k vkSj 
fujh{k.k Eks de ls de 
¼U;qure½ 7 o’kZ dk 
vuqHkoA  

¼ii½ Okg-& 
¼d½lqlaxr O;ogkj lfgarkvksa 
vkSj ijh{k.k izfØ;kvksa] tks 
izpfyr gSa ls voxr gksxk(  

¼[k½ lfUuekZ.k dh lkexzh dh 
QzSDpj ;kaf=dh vkSj /kkrq 
foKku ls voxr  gksa( 

¼x½ m’ek izCka/k@ncko 
fuekZspu okys ?kVdksa vkSj 
fyf¶Vax e”khujh ds fgLlksa 
vkSj fyf¶Vax VSdy 
rduhdksa ls ifjfpr gksxk( 
vkSj  

¼?k½ fyf¶Vax e”khujh] 
tathjksa] jfLL;ksa vksj 
fyf¶Vax VSdy dh lqj{kk 

Ekki] xst ds fy, 
yksM ijh{k.k] ruko 
ijh{k.k] m’.k 
mipkj@ xStV ds 
fy, vkSj fyf¶Vax 
e”khujh VSdy dh 
lqjf{kr dk;ZfLFkfr 
dks fu/kkZfjr djus 
gsrq ,sls vU; 
mI+kLdjksa  dh 
izlqfo/kk,aA 



  

 

ds lac/k esa =qfV;ksa  dh 
igpku djus vksj 
fo”oluh; fu’d’kZ  ij 
igqapus esa Lke{k gksxkA  

5 /kkjk 31& ncko 
la;= 
¼izS”kj IykaV½  

jlk;u ;k 
bYksfDVªªdy ;k /kkrq 
foKku¼esVyftZdy½ 
vFkok eSdsfudy 
bathfu;fjax esa 
mikf/k ;k blds 
led{kA   

¼i½ ¼d½ vfHkdYi ¼fMtkbu½ 
;k fuekZ.k ;k vuqj{k.k 
esa de ls de 10 o’kZ 
dk vuqHko ;k]&  

¼[k½ ncko la;=ksa dk 
ijh{k.k] ijh{kk vkSj  
fujh{k.kA 

¼ii½ Okg-& 
¼d½ ncko ik= ls lqlaxr 

O;oLFkk lafgrkvksa vkSj 
ijh{k.k izfØ;kvksa ls 
vo”; ifjfpr gks( 

 ¼[k½ vfXu”keu jfgr nCkko 
ik=ksa vkSj ncko esa 
ifjpkfyr midj.kksa dh 
lqj{kk ls lacaf/kr oS/kkfud 
vis{kkvksa ls ifjfpr gks( 

 ¼Xk½ ncko ik=ksa ij ykxw 
gksus okyh xSj&fouk”kdkjh 
ijh{k.k rduhdksa ls ifjfpr 
gks(  
¼?k½ =qfVvksa dh igpku djus 
vkSj ncko la;=ksa dh lqj{kk 
ds laca/k esa fo”oluh; 
fu’d’kZ ij igaqpus esa vo”; 
l{ke gksxkA   

gkbMªksfyd ijh{k.k] 
XkSj &foUkk”kdkjh 
ijh{k.k eki gsrq xst] 
midj.k@ ;a= vkSj 
nCkko ik=ksa ds 
mi;ksx esa lqj{kk 
fu/kkZfjr djus gsrq 
dksbZ vU; izlqfo/kk,a 
A  

6 /kkjk 36]& [krjukd 
/kq,a ls lko/kkfu;ka 

¼i½ /kkjk 41 vkSj 112 
ds v/khu tgkt 
fuekZ.k vkSj tgkt 
dh ejEer] ,LcsLVLk 
dk izca/ku vkSj  
izØe.k] foLdksl 
izfØ;k }kjk js;kWu dk 
fofuekZ.k] QkmaMªh 
lapkyuA  

jlk;u foKku esa 
fu’.kkr mikf/k ;k 
jlk;u bathfu;fjax 
esa mikf/kA  

¼i½ Ik;kZoj.k uewuksa ds laxzg 
vkSj fo”ys’k.k vkSj vuqJo.k 
¼eksuhVfjax½ midj.kksa ds 
va”kkdu es de ls de 7 o’kZ 
dk vuqHkoA  
¼ii½ Okg-& 
¼d½ jlk;uksa ds [krjukd 
xq.kksa vkSj muds vuqes; 
lhek ewY;ksa ls ifjfpr 
gks( 

¼[k½ uewuksa dh orZeku 
rduhdksa vkSj fo”ys’k.k 
i;kZoj.k lanw’kdksa ls 

lhfer LFkkuksa es dk;Z 
djus esa lqj{kk ds 
ijh{k.k vkSj 
izek.khdj.k gsrq 
ehVjksa] midj.kksa dk 
vkSj ;a=kas dks fof/kor 
v”kkafdr vkSj  
izekf.kr fd;k tk,A 



  

 

ifjfpr gks( vkSj  
¼Xk½ m’.k dk;Z ds vkjaHk vkSj 
lapkyu ds laca/k esa lqj{kk 
dh ckcr fo”olUkh; fu’d’kZ 
ij igqapus esa l{ke gksA  

7 /kkjk 87 ds v/khu 
cukbZ xbZ fofHkUu 
vuqlwfp;ksa ds v/khu 
;Fkkvisf{kr 
okrkuqdwyu¼oasfVys”ku½ 
iz.kkyh dh vFkkZr~ 
ihlus ;k Xysftax ;k  
/kkrq vkSj muls 
vkuq’kafxd izfØ;kvksa 
ij  vuqlwfp;ka vkSj    
tsV jsr] /kkrq 
“kkWV¼ekj½] ;k fxzV ;k 
Hkki dh laihfM+r ok;q 
ds foLQksV ls izsfjr 
vU; vi?k’kZd }kjk 
oLrqvksa dh LkQkbZ ;k 
fpdukbZ] [kqjnjkiu 
vkfn djukA 

eSdsfudy  ;k   
bysfDVªdy 
bathfu;fjax esa 
mikf/k ;k blds 
led{k  

¼i½ okrkuqdwyu¼oasfVys”ku½ 
iz.kkyh vkSj Ikz.kkfy;ksa  ds 
fMtkbu djus] cukus] 
LFkkiu] ijh{k.k] /kwy] /kwa, 
vkSj ok’Ik vkSj muls 
vkuq’kafxd vU; lgk;d 
midj.kksa ds fUk’d’kZ.k vkSj 
laxzg.k esa U;wure ¼de ls 
de½ 7 o’kZ dk vuqHkoA 

¼ii½ Okg O;ogkj lafgrk vkSj 
ijh{k.k izfØ;kvkssa] tks 
okrkuqdqyu¼oasfVys”ku½ vkSj 
/kq,a gsrq d’kZ.k iz.kkyh ds 
laCka/k esa izpfyr gS ls 
ifjfpr gks] vkSj iz.kkyh dh 
izHkko”khyrk ds laCka/k esa 
fo”oluh; fu’d’kZ ij igqapus 
esa l{ke gksA 

/kwy] ok’Ik vkSj /kq,a 
gsrq fu’d’kZ.k iz.kkyh 
dh izHkko”khyrk dk 
ijh{k.k djus gsrq 
okrkuqdwyu¼oasfVys”ku½  
iz.kkyh] midj.kksa 
vkSj xst ds ijh{k.k 
gsrq izlqfo/kk,a vkSj 
bu iz.kkfy;ksa dh 
n{krk vkSj Ik;kZIrrk 
fu/kkZfjr djus gsrq 
vko”;d dksbZ vU; 
midj.kA mlds  
ikl og ,d mi;qDr 
vfgZr rduhdh 
O;fDr dh lgk;rk 
ysxk tks iz.kkyh  dh 
Ik;kZIrrk ds ckjs es 
mfpr fu’d’kZ ij 
igqap ldsA   

               vkns”k }kjk] 

         lfpo ¼Je ,oa jkstxkj½  
          fgekpy izns”k ljdkj 
     ***  


